
PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:

RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

GENERAL OFFICE - All 13 Companies Bid - Technical and Written Evaluation
Companies Highlighted in Yellow were selected for Oral Evaluations for the General Office Category

FIRM NAMES TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 

POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel 
Services, Inc. 95.00 100.00 17.07 212.07 1 90.00 95.00 17.07 202.07 3 100.00 100.00 17.07 217.07 1 90.00 95.00 17.07

2 BuzzClan, LLC 0.00 0.00 16.73 16.73 13 0.00 0.00 16.73 16.73 13 0.00 0.00 16.73 16.73 13 0.00 0.00 16.73

3 Career Center, Inc. dba 
TempForce, LLC 85.00 100.00 16.47 201.47 4 95.00 95.00 16.47 206.47 2 100.00 100.00 16.47 216.47 3 100.00 100.00 16.47

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions 95.00 90.00 16.54 201.54 3 95.00 95.00 16.54 206.54 1 100.00 100.00 16.54 216.54 2 95.00 100.00 16.54

5 FastTrack Staffing, Inc 15.00 5.00 17.34 37.34 12 15.00 15.00 17.34 47.34 12 0.00 25.00 17.34 42.34 12 10.00 10.00 17.34

6 Mainzer Management Inc. dba 
Techstaff 80.00 90.00 15.35 185.35 5 80.00 70.00 15.35 165.35 8 90.00 88.00 15.35 193.35 6 80.00 90.00 15.35

7 Midtown Personnel, Inc. dba 
The Midtown Group 70.00 90.00 13.85 173.85 6 90.00 90.00 13.85 193.85 4 100.00 100.00 13.85 213.85 4 80.00 90.00 13.85

8 PIC GROUP, INC. 75.00 70.00 16.04 161.04 9 80.00 70.00 16.04 166.04 7 50.00 66.00 16.04 132.04 9 80.00 70.00 16.04

9 Precision Staffing, Inc. dba AP 
Recruiters & Associates 95.00 90.00 17.34 202.34 2 75.00 75.00 17.34 167.34 6 55.00 63.00 17.34 135.34 8 70.00 75.00 17.34

10 RADgov, Inc. 75.00 50.00 14.61 139.61 10 50.00 40.00 14.61 104.61 10 0.00 35.00 14.61 49.61 11 40.00 40.00 14.61

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020

FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

EVALUATOR 1 EVALUATOR 2 EVALUATOR 3 E
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ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK

RANKING 
POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

202.07 3 8 1

16.73 13 52 13

216.47 1 10 3

211.54 2 8 1

37.34 12 48 12

185.35 5 24 6

183.85 6 20 4

166.04 8 33 9

162.34 9 25 7

94.61 11 42 10

EVALUATOR 4

200036 Gen Off



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:

RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

200036-Temporary Services-General Office

ORAL EVALUATIONS

FIRM NAMES ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK
RANKING 

POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel 
Services, Inc. 83.00 83.00 3 85.00 85.00 3 66.00 66.00 4 70.00 70.00 3 13 3

3 Career Center, Inc. dba 
TempForce, LLC 100.00 100.00 1 90.00 90.00 2 89.00 89.00 1 100.00 100.00 1 5 1

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions 70.00 70.00 4 75.00 75.00 4 72.00 72.00 3 60.00 60.00 4 15 4

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020

July 7, 2020

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

FPUR-200036-GD

Evaluator 1 Evaluator 2 Evaluator 3 Evaluator 4

200036 Gen Off Orals



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:

RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

LIGHT LABOR - 10 Companies Bid -Techical & Written Evaluation
Companies Highlighted in Yellow were selected for Oral Evaluations for the Light Labor Category

FIRM NAMES TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 

POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 

POINTS RANK
RANKING 

POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

TOTAL 
POINTS 
(RAW 

SCORES)

3 Career Center, Inc. dba TempForce, 
LLC 85.00 100.00 0.41 185.41 2 95.00 95.00 0.41 190.41 1 100.00 100.00 0.41 200.41 2 100.00 100.00 0.41 200.41 1 6 1 #REF!

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions 95.00 90.00 0.41 185.41 2 95.00 95.00 0.41 190.41 1 100.00 100.00 0.41 200.41 2 95.00 100.00 0.41 195.41 2 7 2 #REF!

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel Services, Inc. 95.00 100.00 0.42 195.42 1 90.00 95.00 0.42 185.42 3 100.00 100.00 0.42 200.42 1 90.00 95.00 0.42 185.42 3 8 3 #REF!

2 Waterford Florida Staffing, LLC dba 
Action Labor and Staffing Connection 88.00 60.00 0.38 148.38 6 90.00 80.00 0.38 170.38 4 90.00 89.00 0.38 179.38 4 90.00 80.00 0.38 170.38 4 18 4 #REF!

9 Precision Staffing, Inc. dba AP 
Recruiters & Associates 95.00 90.00 0.41 185.41 2 75.00 75.00 0.41 150.41 6 55.00 63.00 0.41 118.41 6 70.00 75.00 0.41 145.41 7 21 5 #REF!

10 Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 70.00 80.00 0.44 150.44 5 70.00 70.00 0.44 140.44 7 60.00 67.00 0.44 127.44 5 70.00 80.00 0.44 150.44 5 22 6 #REF!

8 PIC GROUP, INC. 75.00 70.00 0.42 145.42 7 80.00 70.00 0.42 150.42 5 50.00 66.00 0.42 116.42 7 80.00 70.00 0.42 150.42 6 25 7 #REF!

9 TRYFACTA, INC. 55.00 50.00 0.42 105.42 8 40.00 40.00 0.42 80.42 8 45.00 50.00 0.42 95.42 8 50.00 50.00 0.42 100.42 8 32 8 #REF!

5 FastTrack Staffing, Inc 15.00 5.00 0.41 20.41 9 15.00 15.00 0.41 30.41 9 0.00 25.00 0.41 25.41 9 10.00 10.00 0.41 20.41 9 36 9 #REF!

2 BuzzClan, LLC 0.00 0.00 0.44 0.44 10 0.00 0.00 0.44 0.44 10 0.00 0.00 0.44 0.44 10 0.00 0.00 0.44 0.44 10 40 10 #REF!

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020

FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

EVALUATOR 1 EVALUATOR 2 EVALUATOR 3 EVALUATOR 4

200036 Light Labor



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:

RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

200036-Temporary Services-Light Labor

ORAL EVALUATIONS

FIRM NAMES ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK
RANKING 

POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

TOTAL 
POINTS 
(RAW 

SCORES)

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel 
Services, Inc. 83.00 83.00 3 85.00 85.00 3 66.00 66.00 4 70.00 70.00 3 13 3 #REF!

3 Career Center, Inc. dba 
TempForce, LLC 100.00 100.00 1 90.00 90.00 2 89.00 89.00 1 100.00 100.00 1 5 1 #REF!

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions 70.00 70.00 4 75.00 75.00 4 72.00 72.00 3 60.00 60.00 4 15 4 #REF!

5
Waterford Florida Staffing, 
LLC dba Action Labor and 
Staffing Connection

100.00 100.00 1 95.00 95.00 1 84.00 84.00 2 93.00 93.00 2 6 2 #REF!

July 31, 2020

FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Evaluator 1 Evaluator 2 Evaluator 3 Evaluator 4

Temporary Personnel Services

200036 Light Labor Orals



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:

RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

MAINTENANCE/LABOR - 9 Companies Bid - Written & Technical Evaluation
Companies Highlighted in Yellow were selected for Oral Evaluations for the Maintenance/Labor Category

TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 

POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 

POINTS RANK
RANKING 

POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

TOTAL 
POINTS 
(RAW 

SCORES)

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel Services, 
Inc. 95.00 100.00 2.86 197.86 1 90.00 95.00 2.86 187.86 2 100.00 100.00 2.86 202.86 1 90.00 95.00 2.86 187.86 2 6 1 #REF!

3 Career Center, Inc. dba 
TempForce, LLC 85.00 100.00 2.75 187.75 3 95.00 95.00 2.75 192.75 1 100.00 100.00 2.75 202.75 2 100.00 100.00 2.75 202.75 1 7 2 #REF!

4
Waterford Florida Staffing, LLC 
dba Action Labor and Staffing 
Connection

88.00 60.00 2.65 150.65 5 90.00 80.00 2.65 172.65 3 90.00 89.00 2.65 181.65 3 90.00 80.00 2.65 172.65 3 14 3 #REF!

9 Precision Staffing, Inc. dba AP 
Recruiters & Associates 95.00 90.00 2.84 187.84 2 75.00 75.00 2.84 152.84 5 55.00 63.00 2.84 120.84 5 70.00 75.00 2.84 147.84 6 18 4 #REF!

10 Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 70.00 80.00 2.95 152.95 4 70.00 70.00 2.95 142.95 6 60.00 67.00 2.95 129.95 4 70.00 80.00 2.95 152.95 4 18 4 #REF!

8 PIC GROUP, INC. 75.00 70.00 2.89 147.89 6 80.00 70.00 2.89 152.89 4 50.00 66.00 2.89 118.89 6 80.00 70.00 2.89 152.89 5 21 6 #REF!

9 TRYFACTA, INC. 55.00 50.00 2.95 107.95 7 40.00 40.00 2.95 82.95 7 45.00 50.00 2.95 97.95 7 50.00 50.00 2.95 102.95 7 28 7 #REF!

5 FastTrack Staffing, Inc 15.00 5.00 2.84 22.84 8 15.00 15.00 2.84 32.84 8 0.00 25.00 2.84 27.84 8 10.00 10.00 2.84 22.84 8 32 8 #REF!

2 BuzzClan, LLC 0.00 0.00 3.11 3.11 9 0.00 0.00 3.11 3.11 9 0.00 0.00 3.11 3.11 9 0.00 0.00 3.11 3.11 9 36 9 #REF!

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ######

FIRM NAMES

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020

FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

EVALUATOR 4EVALUATOR 1 EVALUATOR 2 EVALUATOR 3

200036 Maint



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:

RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

200036-Temporary Services-Maintenance

ORAL EVALUATIONS
Evaluator 3 Evaluator 4

FIRM NAMES ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK
RANKING 

POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

TOTAL 
POINTS 
(RAW 

SCORES)

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel Services, 
Inc. 83.00 83.00 3 85.00 85.00 3 66.00 66.00 3 70.00 70.00 3 12 3 #REF!

3 Career Center, Inc. dba 
TempForce, LLC 100.00 100.00 1 90.00 90.00 2 89.00 89.00 1 100.00 100.00 1 5 1 #REF!

4
Waterford Florida Staffing, LLC 
dba Action Labor and Staffing 
Connection

100.00 100.00 1 95.00 95.00 1 84.00 84.00 2 93.00 93.00 2 6 2 #REF!

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Evaluator 1 Evaluator 2

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020

FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

200036 Maint Oral



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:
RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

FOOD SERVICE - 8 Companies Bid - Technical and Written Evaluation
Companies Highlighted in Yellow were selected for Oral Evaluations for the Food Service Category

TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 

POINTS RANK TECHNICAL WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK TECHNICAL 

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions 95.00 90.00 0.79 185.79 2 95.00 95.00 0.79 190.79 1 100.00 100.00 0.79 200.79 1 95.00

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel Services, 
Inc. 95.00 100.00 0.76 195.76 1 90.00 95.00 0.76 185.76 2 100.00 100.00 0.76 200.76 2 90.00

2
Waterford Florida Staffing, LLC 
dba Action Labor and Staffing 
Connection

88.00 60.00 0.74 148.74 5 90.00 80.00 0.74 170.74 3 90.00 89.00 0.74 179.74 3 90.00

9 Precision Staffing, Inc. dba AP 
Recruiters & Associates 95.00 90.00 0.76 185.76 3 75.00 75.00 0.76 150.76 4 55.00 63.00 0.76 118.76 5 70.00

10 Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 70.00 80.00 0.89 150.89 4 70.00 70.00 0.89 140.89 5 60.00 67.00 0.89 127.89 4 70.00

11 TRYFACTA, INC. 55.00 50.00 0.79 105.79 6 40.00 40.00 0.79 80.79 6 45.00 50.00 0.79 95.79 6 50.00

5 FastTrack Staffing, Inc 15.00 5.00 0.76 20.76 7 15.00 15.00 0.76 30.76 7 0.00 25.00 0.76 25.76 7 10.00

2 BuzzClan, LLC 0.00 0.00 0.83 0.83 8 0.00 0.00 0.83 0.83 8 0.00 0.00 0.83 0.83 8 0.00

6 Mainzer Management Inc. dba 
Techstaff No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Career Center, Inc. dba 
TempForce, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

EVALUATOR 3

FIRM NAMES

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020
FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

EVALUATOR 1 EVALUATOR 2

200036 Food Service



WRITTEN PRICE ORAL LP TOTAL 
POINTS RANK

RANKING 
POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

100.00 0.79 195.79 1 5 1

95.00 0.76 185.76 2 7 2

80.00 0.74 170.74 3 14 3

75.00 0.76 145.76 5 17 4

80.00 0.89 150.89 4 17 4

50.00 0.79 100.79 6 24 6

10.00 0.76 20.76 7 28 7

0.00 0.83 0.83 8 32 8

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

EVALUATOR 4

200036 Food Service



PROJECT: DATE OF EVALUATION MEETING:
RFP#: PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 

200036-Temporary Services-Food Service

ORAL EVALUATIONS

ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 
POINTS RANK ORAL TOTAL 

POINTS RANK
RANKING 

POINT 
TOTAL

FINAL 
RANKING

1 Ad-VANCE Personnel 
Services, Inc. 83.00 83.00 2 85.00 85.00 2 66.00 66.00 3 70.00 70.00 2 9 2

4 Coherent Staffing Solutions 70.00 70.00 3 75.00 75.00 3 72.00 72.00 2 60.00 60.00 3 11 3

5
Waterford Florida Staffing, LLC 
dba Action Labor and Staffing 
Connection

100.00 100.00 1 95.00 95.00 1 84.00 84.00 1 93.00 93.00 1 4 1

PROPOSAL EVALUATION SUMMARY

Temporary Personnel Services July 31, 2020
FPUR-200036-GD July 7, 2020

200036 Food Service (2)



200036 Food Service (2)




