Bid Iltem

Part 1 - PATCHING

TYPE S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, per ton

APAC-SOUTHEAST, INC.

Alachua County Bid # 07-7

CITY OF GAINESVILLE

BID TABULATION
ALACHUA COUNTY ANNUAL ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACING
BID DATE & TIME: September 13, 2006 at 2:00 p.m.

#060705

JOHN C HIPP CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT CO.

Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00
1561-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00
Type 12.5 (Fine) Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone Il Zone lll ZonelV  ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00
151-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00
Type 9.5 (Fine) Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone Il Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00
151-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00
Type S-lll Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00
1561-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00 | $250.00
Type FC-3 Rubberized Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone Il Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




#060705

Bid Item APAC-SOUTHEAST, INC. JOHN C HIPP CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT CO.
Type FC-9.5 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete Friction Course, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone Il Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type FC-12.5 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete Friction Course, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-250 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part 2- Continuous Paving Operation
TYPE S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone | Zone lll Zone lV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $160.00 | $160.00 | $160.00 | $160.00 | $160.00 $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
151-250 $115.00 | $115.00 | $115.00 | $115.00 | $115.00 $117.00 | $117.00 | $117.00 | $117.00 | $117.00
251-500 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00
501-1000 $93.50 $93.50 $93.50 $93.50 $93.50 $94.00 $94.00 $94.00 $94.00 $94.00
over 1001 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $88.50 $88.50 $88.50 $88.50 $88.50
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone | Zone lll Zone lV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $161.00 | $161.00 | $161.00 | $161.00 | $161.00 $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
151-250 $116.00 | $116.00 | $116.00 | $116.00 | $116.00 $125.00 | $125.00 | $125.00 | $125.00 | $125.00
251-500 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $101.00 | $101.00 | $101.00 | $101.00 | $101.00
501-1000 $94.50 $94.50 $94.50 $94.50 $94.50 $97.75 $97.75 $97.75 | $97.75 $97.75
over 1001 $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone Il Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $166.45 | $166.45 | $166.45 | $166.45 | $166.45 $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
151-250 $121.45 | $121.45 | $121.45 | $121.45 | $121.45 $125.00 | $125.00 | $125.00 | $125.00 | $125.00
251-500 $101.45 | $101.45 | $101.45 | $101.45 | $101.45 $101.00 | $101.00 | $101.00 | $101.00 | $101.00
501-1000 $99.95 | $99.95 $99.95 $99.95 | $99.95 $97.75 $97.75 $97.75 $97.75 $97.75
over 1001 $97.45 | $97.45 $97.45 $97.45 | $97.45 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00 $91.00




#060705

Bid Item APAC-SOUTHEAST, INC. JOHN C HIPP CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT CO.
Type S-lll Asphaltic Concrete, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll Zone lV | Zone V Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $161.00 [ $161.00 | $161.00 | $161.00 | $161.00 $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
151-250 $116.00 [ $116.00 | $116.00 | $116.00 | $116.00 $117.00 | $117.00 | $117.00 | $117.00 | $117.00
251-500 $96.00 | $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 | $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 | $96.00 | $96.00 | $96.00
501-1000 $94.50 | $94.50 $94.50 $94.50 | $94.50 $94.00 $94.00 | $94.00 | $94.00 | $94.00
over 1001 $92.00 | $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 | $92.00 $88.50 $88.50 | $88.50 | $88.50 | $88.50
Type FC-3 (Rubberized) Asphaltic Friction Concrete, per ton (no rubber)
Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll Zone lV | Zone V Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $205.00 | $205.00 | $205.00 | $205.00 | $205.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-250 $160.00 | $160.00 | $160.00 | $160.00 | $160.00 $130.00 | $130.00 | $130.00 | $130.00 | $130.00
251-500 $140.00 | $140.00 | $140.00 | $140.00 | $140.00 $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00
501-1000 $138.50 | $138.50 | $138.50 | $138.50 | $138.50 $104.00 | $104.00 | $104.00 | $104.00 | $104.00
over 1001 $136.00 | $136.00 | $136.00 | $136.00 | $136.00 $98.50 $98.50 | $98.50 | $98.50 | $98.50
Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Friction Course, per ton (no rubber)
Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll Zone lV | Zone V Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $192.50 | $192.50 | $192.50 | $192.50 | $192.50 $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
151-250 $147.50 | $147.50 | $147.50 | $147.50 | $147.50 $130.00 | $130.00 | $130.00 [ $130.00 | $130.00
251-500 $127.50 | $127.50 | $127.50 | $127.50 | $127.50 $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00
501-1000 $126.00 | $126.00 | $126.00 | $126.00 [ $126.00 $102.00 | $102.00 | $102.00 [ $102.00 | $102.00
over 1001 $123.50 | $123.50 | $123.50 | $123.50 | $123.50 $96.00 $96.00 | $96.00 | $96.00 | $96.00
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Friction Course, per ton
Tons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll Zone lV | Zone V Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-150 $188.50 | $188.50 | $188.50 | $188.50 | $188.50 $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 | $400.00
151-250 $143.50 | $143.50 | $143.50 | $143.50 [ $143.50 $130.00 | $130.00 | $130.00 [ $130.00 | $130.00
251-500 $123.50 | $123.50 | $123.50 | $123.50 | $123.50 $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00 | $106.00
501-1000 $122.00 | $122.00 | $122.00 | $122.00 [ $122.00 $102.00 | $102.00 | $102.00 [ $102.00 | $102.00
over 1001 $119.50 | $119.50 | $119.50 | $119.50 | $119.50 $96.00 $96.00 | $96.00 | $96.00 | $96.00




#060705

Bid Item APAC-SOUTHEAST, INC. JOHN C HIPP CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT CO.
Asphalt Emulsion Prime (AEP), per gallon
Gallons Zone | Zone Il Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-500 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
501-1000 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
1001-2000 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
over 2001 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
Prime, RC-70, per gallon
Gallons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
501-1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1001-2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
over 2001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Emulsion, Grade RS-1 (undiluted), per gallon
Gallons Zone | Zone |l Zone lll Zone lV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-500 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00
501-1000 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
1001-2000 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
over 2001 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
Asphalt Emulsion, Grade RS-2 (undiluted), per gallon
Gallons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
501-1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1001-2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
over 2001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART 3-SAND SEALING OPERATIONS
Bituminous material for application of Sand Seal, per gallon
Gallons Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | ZoneV
0-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
501-1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
1001-2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
over 2001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00




Bid Iltem

PART 3-SAND SEALING OPERATIONS

APAC-SOUTHEAST, INC.

Sand Cover material for application of Sand Seal, per cubic yard

#060705

JOHN C HIPP CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT CO.

Cubic Yard Zone | Zone ll Zone lll ZonelV | ZoneV Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00
501-1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00
1001-2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00
over 2001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00
PART 3-SAND SEALING OPERATIONS
Application of Hot Sand-Ho Asphalt Hot Mix, per square yard
Square Yard Zone | Zone ll Zone lll Zone lV | Zone V Zone | Zonell | Zonelll | ZonelV | Zone V
0-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00
501-1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00
1001-2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
over 2001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00

Prepared by:

Diane Holder, Senior Buyer



CITY OF GAINESVILLE
BID TABULATION
ALACHUA COUNTY ANNUAL PLANT MIX ASPHALT CONCRETE
BID DATE & TIME: September 13, 2006 at 2:00 p.m.
ALACHUA COUNTY BID #07-1

Bid ltem

V.E. Whitehurst

Hipp Construction

APAC Southeast, Inc.

AJASPLALTIC CONCRETE

Type S-1
$69.50 $71.00 $62.00
Type S-3
$69.50 $71.00 $63.00
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete
Type SP-12.5 $69.50 $75.00 $63.00
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete
Type SP-9.5 $69.50 $75.00 $67.00
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete
Type FC-6 $69.50 $80.00 $93.00
B] LIQUID ASPHALT
Tack Type RS-1 No bid No bid $6.90
Tack Type RS-2 No bid No bid No bid
Prime Type RC-70 No bid No bid No bid
Prime Type AEP-1 No bid No bid No bid

Prepared by:

Diane Holder, Senior Buyer

#060705



#060705



