

**CITY OF GAINESVILLE**  
**BID TABULATION**  
**ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT SERVICES FOR FY 05/06**  
**BID DATE & TIME: September 19, 2005 at 3:00 p.m.**  
**BID # PWDO060039-DH**

John C. Hipp Construction Equipment Co.\*\*

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.\*

APAC-Southeast, Inc.

BID ITEMS	Leveling < 75 lbs. Prefilling		Quantity		Roads Parking Lots		Leveling < 75 lbs. Prefilling		Quantity		Roads Parking Lots		Leveling < 75 lbs. Prefilling	
	Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity	0 - 250 tons	over 250 tons	Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity	0 - 250 tons	over 250 tons	Quantity	Roads
Work Pay Item 1A Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete	0 - 250 tons over 250 tons	\$ 94.25 \$ 73.25	\$ 100.00 \$ 80.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	N/A N/A	\$ 250.00 \$ 250.00	94.00 \$ 72.50	\$ 94.00 \$ 72.50	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 250.00 \$ 200.00	\$ 1,000.00 \$ 1,000.00	\$ 99.00 \$ 79.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 250.00 \$ 150.00
Work Pay Item 1B Type S-3 Asphaltic Concrete	0 - 250 tons over 250 tons	\$ 94.25 \$ 73.25	\$ 100.00 \$ 80.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 150.00 \$ 120.00	\$ 250.00 \$ 250.00	96.00 \$ 74.50	\$ 96.00 \$ 74.50	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 250.00 \$ 200.00	\$ 1,000.00 \$ 1,000.00	\$ 99.00 \$ 79.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 250.00 \$ 150.00
Work Pay Item 1C Type III Asphaltic Concrete	0 - 250 tons over 250 tons	\$ 94.25 \$ 73.25	\$ 100.00 \$ 80.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 150.00 \$ 120.00	\$ 250.00 \$ 250.00	94.00 \$ 72.50	\$ 94.00 \$ 72.50	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 250.00 \$ 200.00	\$ 1,000.00 \$ 1,000.00	\$ 99.00 \$ 79.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	\$ 250.00 \$ 150.00
Work Pay Item 1D Friction Course FC-3	(no rubber) 0 - 250 tons over 250 tons	\$ 95.00 \$ 74.00	\$ 100.00 \$ 80.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	NA NA	NA NA	125.00 \$ 100.00	\$ 125.00 \$ 100.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	No bid No bid	No bid No bid	No bid No bid	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	No bid No bid
Work Pay Item 1E Friction Course FC-5	0 - 250 tons over 250 tons	No bid No bid	No bid No bid	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	No bid No bid	No bid No bid	\$ 150.00 \$ 125.00	\$ 150.00 \$ 125.00	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	No bid No bid	No bid No bid	No bid No bid	0 - 50 tons over 50 tons	No bid No bid
Work Pay Item 2A Application of Prime Coat Unit Bid Price per Gallon Minimum Trip Fee	\$ 5.00 \$ 250.00						No bid No bid	No bid No bid				No bid No bid		No bid No bid

050524

<p><b>Work Pay Item 2B</b> Application of Tack for Patching Prefilling and courses less than 75 lbs per SY Unit Bid Price per gallon Minimum Trip Fee</p>	<p>\$5.00 \$250.00</p>	<p>No Bid No Bid</p>	<p>\$2.00 \$300.00</p>
<p><b>Work Pay Item 2C</b> Application of Tack Coat for use with Items 1A through 1E Unit Bid Price per Gallon Minimum Trip Fee</p>	<p>\$5.00 \$250.00</p>	<p>\$3.00 \$500.00</p>	<p>\$2.00 \$300.00</p>
<p><b>Work Pay Item 3A</b> Application of Sand Seal Coat Bituminous Material Unit Bid Price per Gallon Minimum Trip Fee</p>	<p>\$5.00 \$250.00</p>	<p>No Bid No Bid</p>	<p>No Bid No Bid</p>
<p><b>Work Pay Item 3B</b> Application of Sand Seal Coat Sand Cover Material Unit Bid Price per Cubic Yard 0-250 cu.yard 250-500 cu. Yard 500-1000 cu. Yard over 1000 cu. Yard Minimum Trip Fee</p>	<p>\$20.00 \$20.00 \$20.00 \$20.00 \$250.00</p>	<p>No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid</p>	<p>No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid</p>
<p><b>Work Pay Item 4</b> Application of Sand Hot-Asphalt Hot Mix Unit Bid Price per Cubic Yard 0-250 cu.yard 250-500 cu. Yard 500-1000 cu. Yard over 1000 cu. Yard</p>	<p>\$12.00 \$12.00 \$8.00 \$5.00</p>	<p>No bid No bid No bid No bid</p>	<p>No bid No bid No bid No bid</p>