

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

**BID OPENING DATE:** 2:00 pm, Wednesday, August 7, 2013

**PLACE OF BID OPENING:** Alachua County Purchasing Division, Third Floor  
 County Administration Building  
 12 SE 1<sup>st</sup> Street  
 Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

TO: The Entities

The undersigned, as Contractor, hereby declares that he has carefully read and examined the specifications and with full knowledge of all conditions under which the equipment and services herein contemplated must be furnished, hereby proposes and agrees to furnish the equipment and services according to the requirements as set out in the specifications for said equipment and service:

All Zones are measured on a radius from the intersection of Main Street and University Avenue as indicated:

Zone I	0.0 - 10 miles
Zone II	10.1 - 15 miles
Zone III	15.1 - 20 miles
Zone IV	20.1 - 25 miles
Zone V	25.1 - 30 miles

**Part 1 –Asphalt Work Category 1:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

## Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13
151-250	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41
251-500	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11
501-1000	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41
Over 1001	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 228.30	\$ 228.30	\$228.30	\$228.30	\$228.30
151-250	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$135.58
251-500	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$112.28
501-1000	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$106.58
Over 1001	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$106.58

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

**BID FORM (CONT'D)**

**BID NUMBER:** **14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville**

**Part 2 - Asphalt Work Category 2:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

**Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88
151-250	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16
251-500	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86
501-1000	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16
Over 1001	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16

**Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13
151-250	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41
251-500	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11
501-1000	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41
Over 1001	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41

**Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$228.30	\$ 228.30	\$228.30	\$228.30	\$228.30
151-250	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58
251-500	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28
501-1000	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58
Over 1001	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57
151-250	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85
251-500	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55
501-1000	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85
Over 1001	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83
151-250	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11
251-500	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81
501-1000	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11
Over 1001	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11

## Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10
151-250	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38
251-500	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08
501-1000	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 128.38
Over 1001	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 128.38

## Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83
151-250	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46
251-500	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81
501-1000	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11
Over 1001	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
 d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10
151-250	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73
251-500	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08
501-1000	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38
Over 1001	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38

## Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83
151-250	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46
251-500	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81
501-1000	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11
Over 1001	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11

## Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10
151-250	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73
251-500	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08
501-1000	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38
Over 1001	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38	\$ 124.38

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

**BID FORM (CONT'D)**

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

**Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 279.48	\$ 279.48	\$ 279.48	\$ 279.48	\$ 279.48
151-250	\$ 171.11	\$ 171.11	\$ 171.11	\$ 171.11	\$ 171.11
251-500	\$ 143.46	\$ 143.46	\$ 143.46	\$ 143.46	\$ 143.46
501-1000	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76
Over 1001	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76	\$ 137.76

**Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 277.23	\$ 277.23	\$ 277.23	\$ 277.23	\$ 277.23
151-250	\$ 168.86	\$ 168.86	\$ 168.86	\$ 168.86	\$ 168.86
251-500	\$ 141.21	\$ 141.21	\$ 141.21	\$ 141.21	\$ 141.21
501-1000	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51
Over 1001	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51	\$ 134.51

**Part 3 - Asphalt Work Category 3:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

**Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88	\$ 216.88
151-250	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16	\$ 124.16
251-500	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86	\$ 100.86
501-1000	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16
Over 1001	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16	\$ 95.16

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13	\$ 219.13
151-250	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41	\$ 126.41
251-500	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11	\$ 103.11
501-1000	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41
Over 1001	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41	\$ 97.41

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$228.30	\$ 228.30	\$28.30	\$228.30	\$228.30
151-250	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$ 135.58	\$135.58
251-500	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$ 112.28	\$112.28
501-1000	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$106.58
Over 1001	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$ 106.58	\$106.58

## Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57	\$ 218.57
151-250	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85	\$ 125.85
251-500	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55	\$ 102.55
501-1000	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85
Over 1001	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85	\$ 96.85

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
 d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83	\$ 243.83
151-250	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11	\$ 151.11
251-500	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81	\$ 127.81
501-1000	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11
Over 1001	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11	\$ 122.11

## Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10	\$ 242.10
151-250	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38	\$ 149.38
251-500	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08	\$ 126.08
501-1000	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 128.38
Over 1001	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 120.38	\$ 128.38

## Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83
151-250	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46
251-500	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81
501-1000	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11
Over 1001	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11	\$ 126.11

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
 d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10
151-250	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73	\$ 158.73
251-500	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08	\$ 131.08
501-1000	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38
Over 1001	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38

## Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83	\$ 268.83
151-250	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46	\$ 160.46
251-500	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81	\$ 132.81
501-1000	\$126.11	\$126.11	\$126.11	\$126.11	\$126.11
Over 1001	\$126.11	\$126.11	\$126.11	\$126.11	\$126.11

## Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10	\$ 267.10
151-250	\$158.73	\$158.73	\$158.73	\$158.73	\$158.73
251-500	\$131.08	\$131.08	\$131.08	\$131.08	\$131.08
501-1000	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38
Over 1001	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38	\$124.38



Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL  
 d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$279.48	\$279.48	\$279.48	\$279.48	\$279.48
151-250	\$171.11	\$171.11	\$171.11	\$171.11	\$171.11
251-500	\$143.46	\$143.46	\$143.46	\$143.46	\$143.46
501-1000	\$137.76	\$137.76	\$137.76	\$137.76	\$137.76
Over 1001	\$137.76	\$137.76	\$137.76	\$137.76	\$137.76

## Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$277.23	\$277.23	\$277.23	\$277.23	\$277.23
151-250	\$168.86	\$168.86	\$168.86	\$168.86	\$168.86
251-500	\$141.21	\$141.21	\$141.21	\$141.21	\$141.21
501-1000	\$134.51	\$134.51	\$134.51	\$134.51	\$134.51
Over 1001	\$134.51	\$134.51	\$134.51	\$134.51	\$134.51

**Part 4 – Additional Traffic Control:** Provide traffic control for work performed by Entities or other contractors for milling and striping in advance or behind paving operations.

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
Hourly Rate	\$187.50	\$187.50	\$187.50	\$187.50	\$187.50
Minimum Daily Rate	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1 Yes No #2 Yes No #3 Yes No

Bidder: John W. Taylor Company: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

Address: 11482 Columbia Park Dr. W, Suite 3, Jacksonville, FL 32258

Authorized Signature: [Handwritten Signature] Title: Vice President

Clearly Print Signature: John W. Taylor Title:

PHONE: 904-288-6300 FAX: 904-288-6301 DATE: 8/7/13

Clearly Print or Type Email Address: jwtaylor@apac.com

Vendor: Name: JOHN C. HIPP CONSTRUCTION Location: ALACHUA, FL #130266

**EXHIBIT A**

**BID FORM**

**BID NUMBER:** 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

**BID OPENING DATE:** 2:00 pm, Wednesday, August 7, 2013

**PLACE OF BID OPENING:** Alachua County Purchasing Division, Third Floor  
County Administration Building  
12 SE 1<sup>st</sup> Street  
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

TO: The Entities

The undersigned, as Contractor, hereby declares that he has carefully read and examined the specifications and with full knowledge of all conditions under which the equipment and services herein contemplated must be furnished, hereby proposes and agrees to furnish the equipment and services according to the requirements as set out in the specifications for said equipment and service:

All Zones are measured on a radius from the intersection of Main Street and University Avenue as indicated:

Zone I	0.0 - 10 miles
Zone II	10.1 - 15 miles
Zone III	15.1 - 20 miles
Zone IV	20.1 - 25 miles
Zone V	25.1 - 30 miles

**Part 1 - Asphalt Work Category 1:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

**Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 400
151-250	\$ 120	\$ 120	\$ 120	\$ 120	\$ 120
251-500	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110
501-1000	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110
Over 1001	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110

**Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton**

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 400
151-250	\$ 120	\$ 120	\$ 120	\$ 120	\$ 120
251-500	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110
501-1000	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110
Over 1001	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110	\$ 110

Vendor: Name: JOHN C Hipp CONSTRUCTION Location: ARCUDA

EXHIBIT A

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

**Part 2 - Asphalt Work Category 2:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>

Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>

Vendor: Name:

John C Hipp Construction

Location:

Aucula, FL

#130266

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER:

14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 100	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 127 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 127 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 127 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 127 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 127 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 124 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 124 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 124 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 124 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 124 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 99 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 99 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 99 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 99 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 99 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Recycle/no rubber

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 110	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 110	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 110	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>

Vendor: Name:

JOHN C. HARRIS CONSTRUCTION

Location:

ARCUDA

#130266

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER:

14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton Recycle, NO RUBBER

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton NO RUBBER

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 120 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 120 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 120 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 120 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 120 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton NO RUBBER

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 117 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 117 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 117 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 117 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 117 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>

Vendor: Name: John C. Hipp Construction Location: Alachua

EXHIBIT A

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 145 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 123 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 115 <sup>00</sup>

**Part 3 - Asphalt Work Category 3:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>

Vendor: Name: JOHN C. HIPP CONSTRUCTION Location: ARCATA #130266

EXHIBIT A

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>



Vendor: Name: JOHN C. HIPP CONSTRUCTION Location: ALACHUA

EXHIBIT A

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton *RECYCLE / NO RUBBER / POLY*

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 154 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 97 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 88 <sup>00</sup>

Vendor: Name:

JOHN C. HIPP CONSTRUCTION

Location:

ALACHUA

#130266

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER:

14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton RECYCLE, NO RUBBER/POLY

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 150 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 92 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 87 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 83 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton NO RUBBER/POLY

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 119 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 103 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 98 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 94 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton NO RUBBER/POLY

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 160 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 116 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 101 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 95 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 91 <sup>00</sup>

Vendor: Name: JOHN C. HIPP CONSTRUCTION Location: Aspen #130266

EXHIBIT A

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 130 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 130 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 130 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 130 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 130 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 112 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 107 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 102 <sup>00</sup>

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 400 <sup>00</sup>
151-250	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 125 <sup>00</sup>
251-500	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 110 <sup>00</sup>
501-1000	\$ 104 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 104 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 104 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 104 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 104 <sup>00</sup>
Over 1001	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 100 <sup>00</sup>

**Part 4 – Additional Traffic Control:** Provide traffic control for work performed by Entities or other contractors for milling and striping in advance or behind paving operations.

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
Hourly Rate	\$ 200 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 200 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 200 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 200 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 200 <sup>00</sup>
Minimum Daily Rate	\$ 750 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 750 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 750 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 750 <sup>00</sup>	\$ 750 <sup>00</sup>

BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1 Yes No #2 Yes No #3 Yes No

Bidder: VIRGINIA H. JOHNS Company: JOHN C. HIPPS CONSTRUCTION

Address: P.O. Box 1000 ALCATRA, FL 32616

Authorized Signature: [Signature] Title: PRESIDENT

Clearly Print Signature: VIRGINIA H. JOHNS Title: PRESIDENT

PHONE: 386-462-2047 FAX: 386-462-4141 DATE: 6/7/13

Clearly Print or Type Email Address: hippave@hotmail.com

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 pm, Wednesday, August 7, 2013

PLACE OF BID OPENING: Alachua County Purchasing Division, Third Floor  
County Administration Building  
12 SE 1<sup>st</sup> Street  
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

TO: The Entities

The undersigned, as Contractor, hereby declares that he has carefully read and examined the specifications and with full knowledge of all conditions under which the equipment and services herein contemplated must be furnished, hereby proposes and agrees to furnish the equipment and services according to the requirements as set out in the specifications for said equipment and service:

All Zones are measured on a radius from the intersection of Main Street and University Avenue as indicated:

Zone I	0.0 - 10 miles
Zone II	10.1 - 15 miles
Zone III	15.1 - 20 miles
Zone IV	20.1 - 25 miles
Zone V	25.1 - 30 miles

**Part 1 –Asphalt Work Category 1:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

## Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
251-500	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
501-1000	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Over 1001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
251-500	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
501-1000	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Over 1001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

## EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

**Part 2 - Asphalt Work Category 2:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

## Type S-I Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
251-500	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
501-1000	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Over 1001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

## Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
251-500	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
501-1000	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Over 1001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 169.15	\$ 169.15	\$ 169.15	\$ 169.15	\$ 169.15
251-500	\$ 130.50	\$ 130.50	\$ 130.50	\$ 130.50	\$ 130.50
501-1000	\$ 111.00	\$ 111.00	\$ 111.00	\$ 111.00	\$ 111.00
Over 1001	\$ 99.50	\$ 99.50	\$ 99.50	\$ 99.50	\$ 99.50

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 172.85	\$ 172.85	\$ 172.85	\$ 172.85	\$ 172.85
251-500	\$ 133.25	\$ 133.25	\$ 133.25	\$ 133.25	\$ 133.25
501-1000	\$ 113.30	\$ 113.30	\$ 113.30	\$ 113.30	\$ 113.30
Over 1001	\$ 93.60	\$ 93.60	\$ 93.60	\$ 93.60	\$ 93.60

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 220.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 220.00
251-500	\$ 168.60	\$ 168.60	\$ 168.60	\$ 168.60	\$ 168.60
501-1000	\$ 142.90	\$ 142.90	\$ 142.90	\$ 142.90	\$ 142.90
Over 1001	\$ 127.50	\$ 127.50	\$ 127.50	\$ 127.50	\$ 127.50

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 209.65	\$ 209.65	\$ 209.65	\$ 209.65	\$ 209.65
251-500	\$ 160.85	\$ 160.85	\$ 160.85	\$ 160.85	\$ 160.85
501-1000	\$ 136.40	\$ 136.40	\$ 136.40	\$ 136.40	\$ 136.40
Over 1001	\$ 121.80	\$ 121.80	\$ 121.80	\$ 121.80	\$ 121.80

Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 202.40	\$ 202.40	\$ 202.40	\$ 202.40	\$ 202.40
251-500	\$ 155.45	\$ 155.45	\$ 155.45	\$ 155.45	\$ 155.45
501-1000	\$ 131.90	\$ 131.90	\$ 131.90	\$ 131.90	\$ 131.90
Over 1001	\$ 117.80	\$ 117.80	\$ 117.80	\$ 117.80	\$ 117.80

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 180.90	\$180.90	\$ 180.90	\$180.90	\$ 180.90
251-500	\$ 139.30	\$139.30	\$ 139.30	\$139.30	\$ 139.30
501-1000	\$ 118.45	\$118.45	\$ 118.45	\$118.45	\$ 118.45
Over 1001	\$ 106.00	\$106.00	\$ 106.00	\$106.00	\$ 106.00

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 220.00	\$220.00	\$ 220.00	\$220.00	\$ 220.00
251-500	\$ 168.60	\$168.60	\$ 168.60	\$168.60	\$ 168.60
501-1000	\$ 142.90	\$142.90	\$ 142.90	\$142.90	\$ 142.90
Over 1001	\$ 127.50	\$127.50	\$ 127.50	\$127.50	\$ 127.50

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 209.65	\$209.65	\$ 209.65	\$209.65	\$ 209.65
251-500	\$ 160.85	\$160.85	\$ 160.85	\$160.85	\$ 160.85
501-1000	\$ 136.40	\$136.40	\$ 136.40	\$136.40	\$ 136.40
Over 1001	\$ 121.80	\$121.80	\$ 121.80	\$121.80	\$ 121.80



Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 241.60	\$ 241.60	\$ 241.60	\$ 241.60	\$ 241.60
251-500	\$ 184.80	\$ 184.80	\$ 184.80	\$ 184.80	\$ 184.80
501-1000	\$ 156.40	\$ 156.40	\$ 156.40	\$ 156.40	\$ 156.40
Over 1001	\$ 139.40	\$ 139.40	\$ 139.40	\$ 139.40	\$ 139.40

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 228.75	\$ 228.75	\$ 228.75	\$ 228.75	\$ 228.75
251-500	\$ 175.15	\$ 175.15	\$ 175.15	\$ 175.15	\$ 175.15
501-1000	\$ 148.35	\$ 148.35	\$ 148.35	\$ 148.35	\$ 148.35
Over 1001	\$ 132.25	\$ 132.25	\$ 132.25	\$ 132.25	\$ 132.25

**Part 3 - Asphalt Work Category 3:** Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
251-500	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
501-1000	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Over 1001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
251-500	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
501-1000	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Over 1001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

## Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 109.15	\$ 109.15	\$ 109.15	\$ 109.15	\$ 109.15
251-500	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15
501-1000	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15
Over 1001	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15	\$ 90.15

## Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 111.45	\$ 111.45	\$ 111.45	\$ 111.45	\$ 111.45
251-500	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45
501-1000	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45
Over 1001	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45	\$ 92.45

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 139.15	\$ 139.15	\$ 139.15	\$ 139.15	\$ 139.15
251-500	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20
501-1000	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20
Over 1001	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20	\$ 114.20

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 132.70	\$ 132.70	\$ 132.70	\$ 132.70	\$ 132.70
251-500	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00
501-1000	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00
Over 1001	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00

Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 129.90	\$ 129.90	\$ 129.90	\$ 129.90	\$ 129.90
251-500	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80
501-1000	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80
Over 1001	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80	\$ 106.80

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

## Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 116.45	\$ 116.45	\$ 116.45	\$ 116.45	\$ 116.45
251-500	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00
501-1000	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00
Over 1001	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00

## Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 140.90	\$ 140.90	\$ 140.90	\$ 140.90	\$ 140.90
251-500	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60
501-1000	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60
Over 1001	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60	\$ 115.60

## Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 134.45	\$ 134.45	\$ 134.45	\$ 134.45	\$ 134.45
251-500	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40
501-1000	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40
Over 1001	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40	\$ 110.40

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

## BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 154.40	\$ 154.40	\$ 154.40	\$ 154.40	\$ 154.40
251-500	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40
501-1000	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40
Over 1001	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40	\$ 126.40

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (\$) per Ton

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
0-150	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
151-250	\$ 146.35	\$ 146.35	\$ 146.35	\$ 146.35	\$ 146.35
251-500	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00
501-1000	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00
Over 1001	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00

**Part 4 – Additional Traffic Control:** Provide traffic control for work performed by Entities or other contractors for milling and striping in advance or behind paving operations.

Tons	Zone I	Zone II	Zone III	Zone IV	Zone V
Hourly Rate	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Minimum Daily Rate	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID


BID FORM (CONT'D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1  Yes No #2 Yes No #3 Yes No

Bidder: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Company: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

Address: 20551 N.E. 75th Street, Williston, FL 32696

Authorized Signature:  Title: President

Clearly Print Signature: William J. Whitehurst Title: President

PHONE: 352-528-2101 FAX: 352-528-3857 DATE: August 5, 2013

Clearly Print or Type Email Address: jcb@atlantic.net