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CITY OF GAINESVILLE
GENERAL GOVERNMENT PURCHASING DIVISION
< " BID RECORD

BiD NAME: ALLISON TRANSMISSION REPAIRS DUE DATE: AUGUST 24, 2005 AT 3:00 PM BID#: RTSX-050191-FP
ﬁﬁ%w UHH;HEHZ‘H” REGIONAL TRANSIT NO. VENDORS SOLICITED: SR 3
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[] BID RECORD (HAND DELIVERED) (SENT) TO USER DEPARTMENT (DATE) .
[] BIDS (HAND DELIVERED) (SENT) TO USER DEPARTMENT (DATE)
__”u”_ BIDS TO BE EYALUATED BY USER DEPARTMENT.
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EVALUAT

Warranty Period:

All exchange rebuilt transmissions are covered
under Transdiesel's warranty for a period of two

ears, (24 months unlimited mileage).

1 year warranty on all units. Exception-six
month warranty on refuse units.

OF ITB FOR Wﬂvkx\ REBUILD OF ALLISON TRANSMISSIONS ITB-050191-R° FP
" 30-Aug-05
Trans Diesel Florida Detroit Diesel-Allison, Inc. Jasper
Remove & Remove & Remove &
Transmission Model Unit Price Core Charge Replace Charge |Unit Price Core Charge Replace Charge {Unit Price Core Charge Replace Charge
AT545 $1,195.00 = $100.00 $650.00 $1,078.44 $700.00 $400.00 $1,713.00 $250.00 No Bid
HT740 $3,045.00 $400.00 $800.00 $3,233.00 $4,000.00 $1,100.00 $5,938.00 $500.00 No Bid
HT747 $3,045.00 $400.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,100.00 $5,938.00 $625.00 No Bid
HTB748R $3,445.00 $500.00 $800.00 $4,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,300.00 $7,003.00 $875.00 No Bid
HT750 $2,995.00 $400.00 $800.00 $3,944.44 $4,000.00 $1,100.00 $7,782.00 $750.00 No Bid
V731D $3,645.00 $500.00 $900.00 $5,777.78 $5,800.00 $1,600.00 $6,627.00 $875.00 No Bid
VR731 $3,945.00 $500.00 $900.00 $5,777.78 $7,500.00 $1,450.00 $6,768.00 $1,000.00 No Bid
B500R $5,045.00 $900.00 $800.00 $6,544.44 $7,800.00 $800.00 $7,780.00 $815.00 No Bid
MD3060P $2,895.00 $900.00 $650.00 $3,577.78 $3,600.00 $650.00 $5,019.00 $875.00 No Bid
MD3560P $2,995.00 $900.00 $650.00 $3,577.78 $3,600.00 $650.00 $6,160.00 $875.00 No Bid
HD4060P $5,195.00 $900.00 $800.00 $6,355.56 $7,400.00 $800.00 $8,919.00 $1.875.00 No Bid
HD4560P $5,195.00 $900.00 $800.00 $6,355.56 $7,800.00 $800.00 $9,117.00 $1,875.00 No Bid
Total: $42,640.00 $7,300.00 $9,350.00 $54,722.56 $63,700.00 $11,750.00 $78,764.00 $11,190.00 $0.00
Transmission 25 25.0 17.92 3.83
R&R charge 10 10.00 7.44 0.00
Labor Rate 5 5.00 3.77 0.00
Core cost 5 5.00 0.00 2.34
45.00 29.13 6.17
Delivery Time 20 20.00 16.66 0.00
Personnel/Resources15. 0.00 0.00 0.00
References 10 10.00 0.00 9.00
Warranty 10 10.00 5.00 10.00
Total score 85.00 50.79 2517
For transmissions not listed or for special repair jobs:
% Labor Rate F $65.00 per hr Labor Rate $81.00 per hr Labor Rate No Bid
Parts Cost (cost + X %) 20% Parts Cost (cost + X %) List - 28% Parts Cost (cost + X %) No Bid
Delivery Time:
Exchange 3 days Exchange 4 days Exchange 2-7 days
R & R, then reinstall 5 days R &R, then reinstall 5 days R &R, then reinstall No Bid

Transmissions: On-Highways Allisons, 2 years
Parts & Labor. Labor does not include removal
and installation.
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EVALUATION OF ITB FOR REPAIR / REBUILD OF ALLISON TRANSMISSIONS ITB-050191-RTSX-FP

Warranty Period:

All exchange rebuilt transmissions are covered
under Transdiesel's warranty for a period of two
ears, (24 months unlimited mileage).

1 year warranty on all units. Exception-six
month warranty on refuse units.

" 30-Aug-05
Trans Diesel Florida Detroit Diesel-Allison, Inc. Jasper
Remove & Remove & Remove &
Transmission Mode} Unit Price Core Charge Replace Charge |Unit Price Core Charge Replace Charge |Unit Price Core Charge Replace Charge
AT545 $1,195.00 $100.00 $650.00 $1,078.44 $700.00 $400.00 $1,713.00 $250,00 No Bid
HT740 $3,045.00 $400.00 $800.00 $3,233.00 $4,000.00 $1,100.00 $5,938.00 $500,00 No Bid
HT747 $3,045.00 $400.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,100.00 $5,938.00 $625.00 No Bid
HTB748R $3,445.00 $500.00 $800.00 $4,500.00 $7.,500.00 $1,300.00 $7,003.00 $875.00 No Bid
HT750 $2,995.00 $400.00 $800.00 $3,944.44 $4,000.00 $1,100.00 $7,782.00 $750.00 No Bid
V731D $3,645.00 $500.00 $900.00 $5,777.78 $5,800.00 $1,600.00 $6,627.00 $875.00 No Bid
VR731 $3,945.00 $500.00 $900.00 $5,777.78 $7,500.00 $1,450.00 $6,768.00 $1,000.00 No Bid
B500R $5,045.00 $900.00 $800.00 $6,544.44 $7,800.00 $800.00 $7,780.00 $815.00 No Bid
MD3060P $2,895.00 $900.00 $650.00 $3,677.78 $3,600.00 $650.00 $5,019.00 $875.00 No Bid
MD3560P $2,995.00 $900.00 $650.00 $3,577.78 $3,600.00 $650.00 $6,160.00 $875.00 No Bid
HD4060P $5,195.00 $900.00 $800.00 $6,355.56 $7,400.00 $800.00 $8,919.00 $1,875.00 No Bid
HD4560P $5,195.00 $900.00 $800.00 $6,355.56 $7,800.00 $800.00 $9,117.00 $1,875.00 No Bid
Total: $42,640.00 $7,300.00 $9,350.00 $54,722.56  $63,700.00 $11,750.00 $78,764.00  $11,190.00 $0.00
Transmission 25 25.0 17.92 3.83
R&R charge 10 10.00 7.44 0.00
Labor Rate 5 5.00 3.77 0.00
Core cost 5 5.00 0.00 2.34
45.00 29.13 6.17
Delivery Time 20 20.00 16.66 0.00
Personnel/Resources15 0.00 0.00 0.00
References 10 10.00 0.00 9.00
Warranty 10 10.00 5.00 10.00
Total score 85.00 50.79 25.17
For transmissions not listed or for special repair jobs:
m Labor Rate _ $65.00 per hr Labor Rate $81.00 per hr Labor Rate No Bid
Parts Cost (cost + X %) 20% ) Parts Cost (cost + X %) List - 28% Parts Cost (cost + X %) No Bid
Delivery Time:
Exchange 3 days Exchange 4 days Exchange 2-7 days
R &R, then reinstall 5 days R &R, then reinstall 5 days R & R, then reinstall No Bid

Transmissions: On-Highways Allisons, 2 years
Parts & Labor. Labor does not include removal
and installation.
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