

Read's

Item No	Item Description	Est Annual Qty	Unit	Year 1 and 2 Unit Price	Year 1 Total	Year 2 Total	Year 3 Unit Price	Year 3 Total	Year 4 unit price	Year 4 Total	Item Amount total Yrs 1-4	no bid
1	Men's (Midnight Navy) Short Sleeve Elbeco Z3314N with patches sewn on.	200	ea	\$ 35.71	\$7,142.00	\$7,142.00	\$ 36.79	\$7,358.00	\$ 37.89	\$7,578.00	\$ 29,220.00	
2	Men's (Midnight Navy) Long Sleeve Shirt Elbeco Z314 with patches sewn on	100	ea	\$ 40.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$ 41.20	\$4,120.00	\$ 42.44	\$4,244.00	\$ 16,364.00	
3	Uniform pants Midnight Navy Elbeco (E314) with stripes sewn on.	200	ea	\$ 40.86	\$8,172.00	\$8,172.00	\$ 42.08	\$8,416.00	\$ 43.35	\$8,670.00	\$ 33,430.00	
4	Women's (Midnight Navy) Short Sleeve Elbeco Z9814LCN with patches sewn on.	100	ea	\$ 35.71	\$3,571.00	\$3,571.00	\$ 36.79	\$3,679.00	\$ 37.89	\$3,789.00	\$ 14,610.00	
5	Women's (Midnight Navy) Long Sleeve Elbeco 9314LCN with patches sewn on.	100	ea	\$ 40.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$ 42.10	\$4,210.00	\$ 42.44	\$4,244.00	\$ 16,454.00	
6	Women's (Midnight Navy) uniform pants Elbeco (E9314LC) with stripes sewn on.	200	ea	\$ 40.86	\$8,172.00	\$8,172.00	\$ 42.08	\$8,416.00	\$ 43.35	\$8,670.00	\$ 33,430.00	
7	5.11 (71167) TACLITE PDU Men's Short Sleeve Shirt, Midnight Navy in color.	200	ea	\$ 39.86	\$7,972.00	\$7,972.00	\$ 41.05	\$8,210.00	\$ 42.28	\$8,456.00	\$ 32,610.00	
8	5.11 (72365) STRYKE CLASS-A TACLITE PDU Men's Long Sleeve Shirt	25	ea	\$ 42.71	\$1,067.75	\$1,067.75	\$ 44.00	\$1,100.00	\$ 45.32	\$1,133.00	\$ 4,368.50	
9	5.11 (74370) TACLITE PDU CARGO CLASS-B Men's Pants	200	ea	\$ 41.53	\$8,306.00	\$8,306.00	\$ 42.77	\$8,554.00	\$ 44.06	\$8,812.00	\$ 33,978.00	
10	5.11 (61167) TACLITE PDU Women's Short Sleeve Shirt	100	ea	\$ 39.86	\$3,986.00	\$3,986.00	\$ 41.05	\$4,105.00	\$ 42.28	\$4,228.00	\$ 16,305.00	
11	5.11 (62365) STRYKE CLASS-A TACLITE PDU Women's Long Sleeve Shirt	25	ea	\$ 42.71	\$1,067.75	\$1,067.75	\$ 44.00	\$1,100.00	\$ 45.32	\$1,133.00	\$ 4,368.50	
12	5.11 (64370) TACLITE PDU CARGO CLASS-B Women's Pants	100	ea	\$ 41.53	\$4,153.00	\$4,153.00	\$ 42.77	\$4,277.00	\$ 44.06	\$4,406.00	\$ 16,989.00	

Argo

Item No	Item Description	Est Annual Qty	Unit	Year 1 and 2 Unit Price	Year 1 Total	Year 2 Total	Year 3 Unit Price	Year 3 Total	Year 4 unit price	Year 4 Total	Item Amount total Yrs 1-4	No Bid
1	Men's (Midnight Navy) Short Sleeve Elbeco Z3314N with patches sewn on.	200	ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 6,666.00	\$ 6,666.00	\$ 33.92	\$ 6,784.00	\$ 34.52	\$ 6,904.00	\$ 27,020.00	
2	Men's (Midnight Navy) Long Sleeve Shirt Elbeco Z314 with patches sewn on	100	ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 3,846.00	\$ 3,846.00	\$ 39.15	\$ 3,915.00	\$ 39.86	\$ 3,986.00	\$ 15,593.00	
3	Uniform pants Midnight Navy Elbeco (E314) with stripes sewn on.	200	ea	\$ 38.56	\$ 7,712.00	\$ 7,712.00	\$ 38.98	\$ 7,796.00	\$ 39.55	\$ 7,910.00	\$ 31,130.00	
4	Women's (Midnight Navy) Short Sleeve Elbeco Z9814LCN with patches sewn on.	100	ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 3,333.00	\$ 3,333.00	\$ 33.92	\$ 3,392.00	\$ 34.56	\$ 3,456.00	\$ 13,514.00	
5	Women's (Midnight Navy) Long Sleeve Elbeco 9314LCN with patches sewn on.	100	ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 3,846.00	\$ 3,846.00	\$ 39.15	\$ 3,915.00	\$ 39.86	\$ 3,986.00	\$ 15,593.00	
6	Women's (Midnight Navy) uniform pants Elbeco (E9314LC) with stripes sewn on.	200	ea	\$ 38.08	\$ 7,616.00	\$ 7,616.00	\$ 38.63	\$ 7,726.00	\$ 39.19	\$ 7,838.00	\$ 30,796.00	
7	5.11 (71167) TACLITE PDU Men's Short Sleeve Shirt, Midnight Navy in color.	200	ea	\$ 52.44	\$10,488.00	\$10,488.00	\$ 54.01	\$10,802.00	\$ 55.50	\$11,100.00	\$ 42,878.00	
8	5.11 (72365) STRYKE CLASS-A TACLITE PDU Men's Long Sleeve Shirt	25	ea	\$ 52.44	\$ 1,311.00	\$ 1,311.00	\$ 54.01	\$ 1,350.25	\$ 55.50	\$ 1,387.50	\$ 5,359.75	
9	5.11 (74370) TACLITE PDU CARGO CLASS-B Men's Pants	200	ea	\$ 52.44	\$10,488.00	\$10,488.00	\$ 54.01	\$10,802.00	\$ 55.50	\$11,100.00	\$ 42,878.00	
10	5.11 (61167) TACLITE PDU Women's Short Sleeve Shirt	100	ea	\$ 52.44	\$ 5,244.00	\$ 5,244.00	\$ 54.01	\$ 5,401.00	\$ 55.50	\$ 5,550.00	\$ 21,439.00	
11	5.11 (62365) STRYKE CLASS-A TACLITE PDU Women's Long Sleeve Shirt	25	ea	\$ 52.44	\$ 1,311.00	\$ 1,311.00	\$ 54.01	\$ 1,350.25	\$ 55.50	\$ 1,387.50	\$ 5,359.75	
12	5.11 (64370) TACLITE PDU CARGO CLASS-B Women's Pants	100	ea	\$ 52.44	\$ 5,244.00	\$ 5,244.00	\$ 54.01	\$ 5,401.00	\$ 55.50	\$ 5,550.00	\$ 21,439.00	

28	Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Accent Tactical Pants for SWAT	20 ea	\$ 42.36	\$ 847.20	\$ 847.20	\$ 43.63	\$ 872.60	\$ 44.94	\$ 898.80	\$ 3,465.80	
29	5.11 Performance polo - Men's / Women's, Silver Tan (71049)	100 ea	\$ 43.79	\$ 4,379.00	\$ 4,379.00	\$ 45.10	\$ 4,510.00	\$ 46.45	\$ 4,645.00	\$ 17,913.00	
30	5.11 74003 TDU Pants Men's / Women's, Dark Navy	100 ea	\$ 38.21	\$ 3,821.00	\$ 3,821.00	\$ 39.35	\$ 3,935.00	\$ 40.54	\$ 4,054.00	\$ 15,631.00	
31	Elbeco 3319N Men's (French Blue) Short Sleeve Polyester Shirt	25 ea	\$ 35.71	\$ 892.75	\$ 892.75	\$ 36.79	\$ 919.75	\$ 37.89	\$ 947.25	\$ 3,652.50	
32	Elbeco 9313LCN Men's (French Blue) Long Sleeve Polyester Shirt.	10 ea	\$ 40.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 41.20	\$ 412.00	\$ 42.44	\$ 424.40	\$ 1,636.40	
33	Elbeco 9819LCN Women's (French Blue) Short Sleeve Polyester shirt	25 ea	\$ 35.71	\$ 892.75	\$ 892.75	\$ 36.79	\$ 919.75	\$ 37.89	\$ 947.25	\$ 3,652.50	
34	Elbeco 9313LCN Women's (French Blue) Long Sleeve Polyester shirt	10 ea	\$ 40.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 41.20	\$ 412.00	\$ 42.44	\$ 424.40	\$ 1,636.40	
35	Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Elbeco Z3313N) Blue - School Crossing Guard patches sewn on.	25 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	
36	Men's Long Sleeve (Elbeco 313N) Blue - School Crossing Guard with patches sewn on.	10 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	
37	Men's Crossing Guard Shorts (Elbeco E2824) - Navy	5 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	
38	Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Elbeco 9813LCN Blue - School Crossing Guard Shirt	25 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	
39	Women's Long Sleeve (Elbeco 9313LCN) Blue - School Crossing Guard with patches sewn on.	10 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	
40	Women's Crossing Guard Shorts (Elbeco E2834LC) Tek3Shirt	5 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	
41	Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Elbeco Z3313N) Blue - Police Explorer Shirt	10 ea	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid	

28	Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Accent Tactical Pants for SWAT	20 ea	\$ 48.99	\$ 979.80	\$ 979.80	\$ 48.99	\$ 979.80	\$ 48.99	\$ 979.80	\$ 50.35	\$ 1,007.00	\$ 3,946.40
29	5.11 Performance polo - Men's / Women's, Silver Tan (71049)	100 ea	\$ 57.33	\$ 5,733.00	\$ 5,733.00	\$ 58.39	\$ 5,839.00	\$ 59.47	\$ 5,947.00	\$ 23,252.00		
30	5.11 74003 TDU Pants Men's / Women's, Dark Navy	100 ea	\$ 49.99	\$ 4,999.00	\$ 4,999.00	\$ 51.37	\$ 5,137.00	\$ 52.80	\$ 5,280.00	\$ 20,415.00		
31	Elbeco 3319N Men's (French Blue) Short Sleeve Polyester Shirt	25 ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 833.25	\$ 833.25	\$ 33.92	\$ 848.00	\$ 34.52	\$ 863.00	\$ 3,377.50		
32	Elbeco 9313LCN Men's (French Blue) Long Sleeve Polyester Shirt.	10 ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 384.60	\$ 384.60	\$ 39.15	\$ 391.50	\$ 39.86	\$ 398.60	\$ 1,559.30		
33	Elbeco 9819LCN Women's (French Blue) Short Sleeve Polyester shirt	25 ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 833.25	\$ 833.25	\$ 33.92	\$ 848.00	\$ 34.52	\$ 863.00	\$ 3,377.50		
34	Elbeco 9313LCN Women's (French Blue) Long Sleeve Polyester shirt	10 ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 384.60	\$ 384.60	\$ 39.15	\$ 391.50	\$ 39.86	\$ 398.60	\$ 1,559.30		
35	Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Elbeco Z3313N) Blue - School Crossing Guard patches sewn on.	25 ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 833.25	\$ 833.25	\$ 33.92	\$ 848.00	\$ 34.52	\$ 863.00	\$ -	3377.5	
36	Men's Long Sleeve (Elbeco 313N) Blue - School Crossing Guard with patches sewn on.	10 ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 384.60	\$ 384.60	\$ 39.15	\$ 391.50	\$ 39.86	\$ 398.60	\$ -	1559.3	
37	Men's Crossing Guard Shorts (Elbeco E2824) - Navy	5 ea	\$ 44.94	\$ 224.70	\$ 224.70	\$ 45.77	\$ 228.85	\$ 46.64	\$ 233.20	\$ -	911.45	
38	Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Elbeco 9813LCN Blue - School Crossing Guard Shirt	25 ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 833.25	\$ 833.25	\$ 33.92	\$ 848.00	\$ 34.52	\$ 863.00	\$ -	3377.5	
39	Women's Long Sleeve (Elbeco 9313LCN) Blue - School Crossing Guard with patches sewn on.	10 ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 384.60	\$ 384.60	\$ 39.15	\$ 391.50	\$ 39.86	\$ 398.60	\$ -	1559.3	
40	Women's Crossing Guard Shorts (Elbeco E2834LC) Tek3Shirt	5 ea	\$ 44.94	\$ 224.70	\$ 224.70	\$ 45.77	\$ 228.85	\$ 46.64	\$ 233.20	\$ -	911.45	
41	Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Elbeco Z3313N) Blue - Police Explorer Shirt	10 ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 333.30	\$ 333.30	\$ 33.92	\$ 339.20	\$ 34.52	\$ 345.20	\$ -	1351	

43	Men's Long Sleeve (Eibeco 313N Blue - Police Explorer Shirt	10 ea		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid
43	Eibeco (E314) 100% Polyester stretch textured serge weave uniform pants	10 ea	\$ 31.94	\$ 319.40	\$ 319.40	\$ 32.90	\$ 329.00	\$ 33.89	\$ 338.90	\$ 1,306.70	
44	Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Eibeco 9813LCN) Blue	10 ea		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid
45	Women's Long Sleeve Shirt (Eibeco 9313LCN) Blue	10 ea		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	no bid
46	Eibeco (E9314LC) 100% Polyester stretch textured serge weave uniform pants -women's pants	10 ea	\$ 31.94	\$ 319.40	\$ 319.40	\$ 32.90	\$ 329.00	\$ 33.89	\$ 338.90	\$ 1,306.70	
47	5.11 (74439) FAST-TAC Cargo Pants -BDU for K-9 Units	25 ea	\$ 38.21	\$ 955.25	\$ 955.25	\$ 39.35	\$ 983.75	\$ 40.54	\$1,013.50	\$ 3,907.75	
48	5.11 (41192) HELIOS SHORT SLEEVE POLO SHIRT for K-9 Units	25 ea	\$ 45.10	\$1,127.50	\$1,127.50	\$ 46.45	\$1,161.25	\$ 47.85	\$1,196.25	\$ 4,612.50	

\$ 356,767.65

42	Men's Long Sleeve (Eibeco 313N Blue - Police Explorer Shirt	10 ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 384.60	\$ 384.60	\$ 39.15	\$ 391.50	\$ 39.86	\$ 398.60	\$ -	1559.3
43	Eibeco (E314) 100% Polyester stretch textured serge weave uniform pants	10 ea	\$ 32.06	\$ 320.60	\$ 320.60	\$ 32.62	\$ 326.20	\$ 33.19	\$ 331.90	\$ 1,299.30	
44	Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Eibeco 9813LCN) Blue	10 ea	\$ 33.33	\$ 333.30	\$ 333.30	\$ 33.92	\$ 339.20	\$ 34.52	\$ 345.20	\$ 1,351.00	1351
45	Women's Long Sleeve Shirt (Eibeco 9313LCN) Blue	10 ea	\$ 38.46	\$ 384.60	\$ 384.60	\$ 39.15	\$ 391.50	\$ 39.86	\$ 398.60	\$ 1,559.30	1559.3
46	Eibeco (E9314LC) 100% Polyester stretch textured serge weave uniform pants -women's pants	10 ea	\$ 32.06	\$ 320.60	\$ 320.60	\$ 32.62	\$ 326.20	\$ 33.19	\$ 331.90	\$ 1,299.30	
47	5.11 (74439) FAST-TAC Cargo Pants -BDU for K-9 Units	25 ea	\$ 49.70	\$ 1,242.50	\$ 1,242.50	\$ 52.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 53.42	\$ 1,335.50	\$ 5,120.50	
48	5.11 (41192) HELIOS SHORT SLEEVE POLO SHIRT for K-9 Units	25 ea	\$ 62.79	\$ 1,569.75	\$ 1,569.75	\$ 64.16	\$ 1,604.00	\$ 65.56	\$ 1,639.00	\$ 6,382.50	

\$ 397,196.20