
 
 

 
 

GENERAL MANAGER CONSENT ITEM #061032   
 

 

PURCHASING DIVISION 

GAINESVILLE REGIONAL UTILITIES 

 
BID TAB 

JANITORIAL SERVICES 
2007 – 050 

             

     
            

      
            

      
            

      
            

ADMIN BUILDING Brown's   C& S Coverall 
Dust Be 
Gone E & C  

EW 
Reshard 

Extreme 
Kleen F and K  GQ  Superglo  Wanda's   

Bid Price $65,320  $68,301  $94,944  $62,000  $84,150  $60,150  $64,436  NO BID $83,000  $60,384  NO BID  
Evaluated Score 
 

48.83  85.23  75.34  57.81  
 

49.59  
 

73.00  
 

68.34  NO BID 
 

42.99  
 

69.84  
 

NO BID 
 

 

OC COMPOUND 
Bid Price $49,125  $53,044  $47,880  $45,000  $53,550  $49,000  $68,641  NO BID $79,000  $43,260  $84,000  
Evaluated Score 
 

47.22  82.62  86.14  57.45  
 

53.31  
 

68.31  
 

56.21  NO BID 
 

35.90  
 

70.00  
 

36.60   

FS AND W/WW  
Bid Price $44,100 $41,523  $39,672  $38,500  $45,700  $40,575  $43,700  NO BID $50,000  $31,920  $48,000   
Evaluated Score 
 

40.95  80.75  82.18  52.16  
 

48.94  
 

64.47  
 

60.22  NO BID 
 

39.54  
 

70.00  
 

42.60   

WELLNESS CENTER  
Bid Price $16,800  $16,381 $14,928  $14,500  $27,600  $15,495  $14,000  NO BID $20,000  $14,472  $15,550   
Evaluated Score 
 

45.33  84.19  87.51  57.62  
 

53.31  
 

69.14  
 

71.00  NO BID 
 

42.00  
 

68.70  
 

52.01   

SH CENTER 
Bid Price $13,488  NO BID $19,188  $13,000  $33,966  $12,304  $23,800  $26,000.00 NO BID $26,280  $22,000   
Evaluated Score 48.49  NO BID 75.65  56.86  35.49  73.00  51.68  31.93  NO BID 48.73  38.37   

 
 
 
 
Copies of all the bids are on file in Utilities Purchasing and are available for inspection.  

 
 
 
 

Prepared by Alex Corvetto, Buyer Analyst 
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