

**CITY OF GAINESVILLE
BID TABULATION**

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT SERVICES for FY 98/99

BID DATE & TIME: September 29, 1998 at 3:00 p.m.

BID # PWDS990013-DH

White Construction Co., Inc.

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

BID ITEMS		White Construction Co., Inc.										V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.										
*	Work Pay Item 1A Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete	Leveling < 75 lbs.					Patching & Prefilling					Leveling < 75 lbs.					Patching & Prefilling					
		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		
		0 - 250 tons	\$ 43.20	\$ 46.44	0 - 10 tons	\$ 162.00	\$ 205.20	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	No bid
		250 - 500 tons	\$ 41.04	\$ 46.44	12 - 25 tons	\$ 81.00	\$ 108.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	No bid
		500 - 1000 tons	\$ 39.96	\$ 43.20	25 - 50 tons	\$ 64.80	\$ 108.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	No bid
		over 1000 tons	\$ 39.42	\$ 43.20	over 50 tons	\$ 54.00	\$ 108.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 55.00	No bid
*	Work Pay Item 1B Type S-3 Asphaltic Concrete	Leveling < 75 lbs.					Patching & Prefilling					Leveling < 75 lbs.					Patching & Prefilling					
		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		
		0 - 250 tons	\$ 43.20	\$ 46.44	0 - 10 tons	\$ 162.00	\$ 205.20	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	No Bid
		250 - 500 tons	\$ 41.04	\$ 46.44	12 - 25 tons	\$ 81.00	\$ 108.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	No Bid
		500 - 1000 tons	\$ 39.96	\$ 43.20	25 - 50 tons	\$ 64.80	\$ 108.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	No Bid
		over 1000 tons	\$ 39.42	\$ 43.20	over 50 tons	\$ 54.00	\$ 108.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 55.00	No Bid
*	Work Pay Item 1C Type III Asphaltic Concrete	Leveling < 75 lbs.					Patching & Prefilling					Leveling < 75 lbs.					Patching & Prefilling					
		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		Quantity	Roads	Parking Lots	Quantity		
		0 - 250 tons	\$ 43.20	\$ 46.44	0 - 10 tons	\$ 162.00	\$ 205.20	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	No Bid
		250 - 500 tons	\$ 41.04	\$ 46.44	12 - 25 tons	\$ 81.00	\$ 108.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	No Bid
		500 - 1000 tons	\$ 39.96	\$ 43.20	25 - 50 tons	\$ 64.80	\$ 108.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	No Bid
		over 1000 tons	\$ 39.42	\$ 43.20	over 50 tons	\$ 54.00	\$ 108.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 55.00	No Bid
*	Work Pay Item 1D Friction Course	FC-3					FC-3					FC-3					FC-3					
		Quantity	w/out rubber	with rubber	Quantity		Quantity	w/out rubber	with rubber	Quantity		Quantity	w/out rubber	with rubber	Quantity		Quantity	w/out rubber	with rubber	Quantity		
		0 - 250 tons	\$ 45.08	\$ 47.44	0 - 10 tons	\$ 162.00	\$ 205.20	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 250 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	0 - 10 tons	\$ 64.00	No Bid
		250 - 500 tons	\$ 45.08	\$ 47.44	12 - 25 tons	\$ 81.00	\$ 108.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	250 - 500 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	12 - 25 tons	\$ 43.00	No Bid
		500 - 1000 tons	\$ 45.08	\$ 47.44	25 - 50 tons	\$ 64.80	\$ 108.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	500 - 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	25 - 50 tons	\$ 43.00	No Bid
		over 1000 tons	\$ 45.08	\$ 47.44	over 50 tons	\$ 54.00	\$ 108.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 1000 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	over 50 tons	\$ 55.00	No Bid

1. 980692

Work Pay Item 2 Application of Prime Coat Unit Bid Price per Gallon Minimum Trip Fee	\$2.70 \$216.00	\$ 3.00 \$ 300.00	
Work Pay Item 2A Application of Tack for Patching Prefilling and courses less than 75 lbs per SY Unit Bid Price per gallon Minimum Trip Fee	\$5.40 \$216.00	No Bid	
Work Pay Item 3 Application of Sand Seal Coat Work Pay Item 3A Bituminous Material Unit Bid Price per Gallon Minimum Trip Fee	\$2.70 \$216.00	No Bid	
Work Pay Item 3B Sand Cover Material Unit Bid Price per Cubic Yard Minimum Trip Fee	\$21.60 \$216.00	No Bid No Bid	
Work Pay Item 4 Application of Sand-Asphalt Hot Mix	Quantity 0 - 250 tons \$ 10.80 250 - 500 tons \$ 8.10 500 - 1000 tons \$ 5.40 over 1000 tons \$ 2.70	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid	
Material Pay Item 1A Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete Unit Bid Price per Ton	\$36.18	\$34.00	*
Material Pay Item 1B Type S-3 Asphaltic Concrete Unit Bid Price per Ton	\$36.18	\$34.00	*

White Construction Co., Inc.

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

Material Pay Item 1C Type III Asphaltic Concrete Unit Bid Price per Ton	\$36.18	*	\$34.00

* Recommended Award

EXPLANATION: Based on low bid meeting specifications.

A copy of the completed vendor list, all proposal documents, all statements received and a signed Bid Record are on file in General Government Purchasing and are available for inspection.

Prepared by: Diane Holder
Diane Holder, Buyer II