#130266

Vendor: Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL

d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 pm, Wednesday, August 7, 2013
PLACE OF BID OPENING: Alachua County Purchasing Division, Third Floor

County Administration Building
12 SE 1% Street
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

TO: The Entities
The undersigned, as Contractor, hereby declares that he has carefully read and examined the specifications and with full knowledge ofall
conditions under which the equipment and services herein contemplated must be furnished, hereby proposes and agrees to furnish the

equipment and services according to the requirements as set out in the specifications for said equipment and service:

All Zones are measured on a radius from the intersection of Main Street and University Avenue as indicated:

Zone I 0.0 - 10 miles
Zone 11 10.1 - 15 miles
Zone 111 15.1 - 20 miles
Zone [V 20.1 - 25 miles
Zone V 25.1 - 30 miles

Part 1 -Asphalt Work Category 1: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require
transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $219.13 $219.13 $219.13 $219.13 $ 219.13
151-250 $126.41 $126.41 $126.41 $ 126.41 $ 126.41
251-500 $103.11 $103.11 $103.11 $ 103.11 $ 103.11
501-1000 $97.41 $97.41 $97.41 $97.41 $ 97.41
Over 1001 $97.41 $97.41 $97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zonel Zone II Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $228.30 $ 228.30 $228.30 $228.30 $228.30
151-250 $135.58 $135.58 $ 135.58 $ 135.58 $135.58
251-500 $112.28 $112.28 $112.28 $ 112.28 $112.28
501-1000 $106.58 $ 106,58 $106.58 $ 106.58 $106.58
Over 1001 $106.58 $106.58 $ 106.58 $ 106.58 $106.58
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#130266

Vendor: Name: Jacksonville, FL

Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location:

d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)

BID NUMBER; 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Part2 - Asphalt Work Category 2: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require
transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $216.88 $216.88 $ 216.88 $ 216.88 $ 216.88
151-250 $124.16 $124.16 $124.16 $ 124,16 $ 124.16
251-500 $100.86 $ 100.86 $ 100.86 $ 100.86 $ 100.86
501-1000 $95.16 $95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16
Over 1001 $95.16 $95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16

Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $219.13 $219.13 $ 219.13 $ 219.13 $ 219.13
151-250 $126.41 $126.41 $ 126.41 $ 126.41 $ 126.41
251-500 $103.11 $103.11 $103.11 $ 103.11 $ 103.11
501-1000 $97.41 $97.41 $97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41
Over 1001 $97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $228.30 $228.30 ®28.30 228.30 $228.30
151-250 $ 135.58 $ 135.58 $ 135.58 $ 135.58 $135.58
251-500 $112.28 $112.28 $112.28 $ 112.28 $112.28
501-1000 $106.58 $ 106.58 $ 106.58 $ 106.58 $106.58
Over 1001 $106.58 $106.58 $ 106.58 $ 106.58 $106.58
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#130266

Vendor; Name: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone I11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $218.57 $218.57 $ 218.57 $ 218.57 $ 218.57
151-250 $125.85 $125.85 $ 125.85 $ 125.85 $ 125.85
251-500 $102.55 $102.55 $ 102.55 $ 102.55 $ 102.55
501-1000 $96.85 $96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85
Over 1001 $96.85 $96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone II Zone 11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $243.83 $243.83 $ 243.83 $ 243.83 $ 243.83
151-250 $151.11 $151.11 $ 151.11 $ 151.11 $ 151.11
251-500 $127.81 $127.81 $127.81 $ 127.81 $ 127.81
501-1000 $122.11 $122.11 $122.11 $ 122.11 $ 122.11
Over 1001 $122.11 $122.11 $122.11 $122.11 $ 122.11
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $242.10 $242.10 $ 242.10 $ 242.10 $ 242.10
151-250 $149.38 $149.38 $ 149.38 $ 149.38 $ 149.38
251-500 $126.08 $126.08 $ 126.08 $ 126.08 $ 126.08
501-1000 $120.38 $120.38 $ 120.38 $ 120.38 $ 128.38
Over 1001 $120.38 $120.38 $120.38 $ 120.38 $ 128.38
Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $268.83 $ 268.83 $ 268.83 $ 268.83 $ 268.83
151-250 $160.46 $160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46
251-500 $132.81 $132.81 $§132.81 $ 132.81 $ 132.81
501-1000 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 $ 126.11 $ 126.11
‘Over1001 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 $ 126.11 $ 126,11

23




Vendor: Name:

#130266

Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: Jacksonville, FL

d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $267.10 $267.10 $267.10 $ 267.10 267.10
151-250 $158.73 $158.73 $ 158.73 $ 158.73 158.73
251-500 $131.08 $131.08 $131.08 $ 131.08 131.08
501-1000 $124.38 $124.38 $124.38 $ 124.38 124.38
Over 1001 $124.38 $124.38 $124,38 $ 124.38 124 .38

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 11T Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $268.83 $268.83 $ 268.83 $ 268.83 268.83
151-250 $160.46 $160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46 160.46
251-500 $132.81 $ 132.81 $ 132.81 $ 132.81 132.81
501-1000 $126.11 $126.11 $ 126,11 $ 126.11 126.11
Over 1001 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 126.11

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $267.10 $267.10 $267.10 $ 267.10 267.10
151-250 $158.73 $ 158.73 $ 158.73 $ 158.73 158.73
251-500 $131.08 $131.08 $131.08 $ 131.08 131.08
501-1000 $124 .38 $124.38 $124.38 $ 124.38 124.38
Over 1001 $124.38 $124.38 $124.38 § 124.38 124.38
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Vendor: Name:

Oldcastle Southern Group,

Inc. Location:

d/b/a APAC-Southeast,

BID FORM (CONT’D)

Jacksonville,

#130266

FL

EXHIBIT A

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $279.48 $279.48 $279.48 $ 279.48 279.48
151-250 $171.11 $171.11 $171.11 $ 171.11 171.11
251-500 $143 .46 $143 .46 $ 143.46 $ 143 .46 143.46
501-1000 $137.76 $137.76 $137.76 $ 137.76 137.76
Over 1001 $137.76 $137.76 $137.76 $ 137.76 137.76
Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone II1 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $277.23 $277.23 $277.23 $ 277.23 277 .23
151-250 $168.86 $168.86 $ 168.86 $ 168.86 168.86
251-500 $141.21 $141.21 $141.21 $ 141.21 141.21
501-1000 $134.51 $134.51 $134.51 $ 134.51 134.51
Over 1001 $134.51 $134.51 $134.51 $ 134.51 134 .51

Part 3 - Asphalt Work Category 3: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require

transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone II Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $216.88 $ 216.88 $ 216.88 $ 216.88 216.88
151-250 $124.16 $ 124.16 $ 124.16 $ 124.16 124.16
251-500 $100.86 $ 100.86 $ 100.86 $ 100.86 100.86
501-1000 $95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16 95.16
Over 1001 $95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16 $ 95.16 95.16
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Vendor: Name:

#130266

Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc,. Location: Jacksonville, FL
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc. EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type S-HI Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $219.13 $219.13 $ 219.13 $ 219.13 $ 219.13
151-250 $126.41 $126.41 $ 126.41 $ 126.41 $ 126.41
251-500 $103.11 $103.11 $103.11 $ 103.11 $ 103.11
501-1000 $97.41 $97.41 $97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41
Over 1001 $97.41 $97.41 $97.41 $ 97.41 $ 97.41
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $228.30 $228.30 £28.30 £28.30 $228.30
151-250 $135.58 $135.58 $135.58 $ 135.58 $135.58
251-500 $112.28 $112.28 $112.28 $ 112.28 $112.28
501-1000 $106.58 $106.58 $ 106.58 $ 106.58 $106.58
Over 1001 $106.58 $106.58 $106.58 $ 106.58 $106.58
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone II Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $218.57 $218.57 $218.57 $ 218.57 $ 218.57
151-250 $125.85 $125.85 $ 125.85 $ 125.85 $ 125.85
251-500 $102.55 $102.55 $ 102.55 $ 102.55 $ 102.55
501-1000 $96.85 $96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85
Over 1001 $96.85 $96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85 $ 96.85
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Vendor: Name:

#130266

Location: Jacksonville, FL

Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc.

d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.
BID FORM (CONT’D)

EXHIBIT A

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 11X Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $243.83 $243.83 $ 243.83 $ 243.83 $ 243.83
151-250 $151.11 $151.11 $151.11 $ 151.11 $ 151.11
251-500 $127.81 $127.81 $127.81 $ 127.81 $ 127.81
501-1000 $122.,11 $122.11 $122.11 $ 122.11 $ 122.11
Over 1001 $122.11 $122.11 $122.11 $122.11 $ 122.11
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $242.10 $242.10 $ 242.10 $ 242.10 $ 242.10
151-250 $149.38 $149.38 $ 149.38 $ 149.38 $§ 149.38
251-500 $126.08 $126.08 $ 126.08 $ 126.08 $ 126.08
501-1000 $120.38 $120.38 $ 120.38 $ 120.38 $ 128.38
Over 1001 $120.38 $120.38 $120.38 $ 120.38 $ 128.38
Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $268.83 $268.83 $268.83 $ 268.83 $ 268.83
151-250 $160.46 $160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46
251-500 $132.81 $132.81 $132.81 $ 132.81 $ 132.81
501-1000 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 $ 126.11 $ 126.11
Over 1001 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 $ 126.11 $ 126.11
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Vendor: Name:

Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc Location:
d/b/a APAC-Southeast,

Inc.

BID FORM (CONT’D)

Jacksgsonville,

#130266
FL

EXHIBIT A

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone I11 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $267.10 $ 267.10 $ 267.10 $ 267.10 267.10
151-250 $158.73 $158.73 $ 158.73 ¢ 158.73 158.73
251-500 $131.08 $131.08 $131.08 $ 131.08 131.08
501-1000 $124.38 $124.38 $124.38 $ 124.38 124 .38
Over 1001 $124.38 $124.38 $124.38 $124.38 124.38

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone Il Zone IIX Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $268.83 $268.83 $268.83 $ 268.83 268.83
151-250 $160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46 $ 160.46 160.46
251-500 $132.81 $132.81 $132.81 $ 132.81 132.81
501-1000 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 $126.11 126.11
Over 1001 $126.11 $126.11 $ 126.11 $ 126.11 126.11

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone II Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $267.10 $267.10 $ 267.10 $ 267.10 267.10
151-250 $158.73 $158.73 $158.73 $ 158.73 158.73
251-500 $131.08 $131.08 $131.08 $ 131.08 131.08
501-1000 $124.38 $124.38 $124.38 $ 124.38 124.38
Over 1001 $124.38 $ 124.38 $ 124.38 $ 124.38 124.38
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Vendor: Name:

#130266

Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc. Location: _Jacksonville, FL
d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zonel Zone I1 Zone IT1 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $279.48 $279.48 $279.48 $ 279.48 279.48
151-250 $171.11 $171.11 $171.11 $171.11 171.11
251-500 $143.46 $143.46 $143.4¢6 $ 143 .46 143 .46
501-1000 $137.76 $137.76 $ 137.76 $ 137.76 137.76
Over 1001 $137.76 $137.76 $ 137.76 $ 137.76 137.76
Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 1 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $277.23 $277.23 $277.23 $ 277.23 277.23
151-250 $168.86 $168.86 $ 168.86 $ 168.86 168.86
251-500 $141.21 $141.21 $141.21 $ 141.21 141.21
501-1000 $134.51 $134.51 $134.51 $ 134.51 134.51
Over 1001 $134.51 $134.51 $ 134.51 $ 134.51 134.51

Part 4 — Additional Traffic Control: Provide traffic control for work performed by Entities or other contractors for milling and striping in
advance or behind paving operations.

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone III Zone IV Zone V
Hourly Rate $187.50 $187.50 $187.50 $187.50 $ 187.50
Minimum Daily Rate | $1,500.00( $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
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#130266

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1 No #2 Yes #3 Y

Bidder: John W. Taylor Company: Oldcastle Southern Group, Inc.

d/b/a APAC-Southeast, Inc.

Address: 11482 Columbia Park Dr. W, Suite 3, Jacksonville, FI, 32258

Title: Vice President

Clearly Print Signature: John W. Taylor Title:
PHONE: 904-288-6300 FAX: 904-288-6301 DATE: 8/7/13
Clearly Print or Type Email Address: jwtaylor@apac.com
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#130266
/‘“ B
Vendor: Name:  JOHN (I /’L\ DO QNSWLW\/ , Location: /4(4).(,4-}4»/3., }Z
‘ 1/ ) ,

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Conerete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 pm, Wednesday, August 7, 2013

PLACE OF BID OPENING: Alachua County Purchasing Division, Third Floor
County Administration Building
12 SE 1* Street
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

TO: The Entities
The undersigned, as Contractor, hereby declates that he has carefully read and examined the specifications and with full knowledge of all
conditions under which the equipment and services herein contemplated must be furnished, hereby proposes and agrees to furnish the

equipment and services according to the requirements as set out in the specifications for said equipment and service:

All Zones are measured on a radius from the intersection of Main Street and University Avenue as indicated:

Zonel 0.0 - 10 miles
Zone 11 10.1 - 15 miles
Zone 11 15.1 - 20 miles
Zone IV 20.1 - 25 miles
Zone V 25.1 - 30 miles

Part 1 —Asphalt Work Category 1: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require
transport until completion of project, If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1II Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone1 Zone I Zone 11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 s 40 S 200 $ 400 S 4D S 40l
151-250 s 20 $ /190 $ /o0 $ /o0 5 o
251-500 s /10 7l 5 40 s 40 I,
501-1000 s N /) $ )0 $ /0 $ YO
Over 1001 s /0 $ N0 s /0 /Y $ /0

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone I Zone IV Zone V
0-150 5 400 $ {'00 5 4o s 400 /)
151-250 5/ X S 0 $ /0 $ W $ 100
s s J)) s p0 s g0 S 40 S 40

501-1000 $ )0 5 /0 )0 $ M S 40

Over 1001 s {10 ) S )0 s /o $ 110
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Vendor: Name: ’ﬂ)gﬁgi C %F‘ QNgrﬂ)\)C/T?,Q{\I

BID FORM (CONT’D)

BID NUMBER:

Location: M

#130266

EXHIBIT A

14-~7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Part2 - Asphalt Work Category 2: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require

transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone 1T Zone I Zone IV Zone V
0-150 s 400 v S 440D “ s M % s 40~ s 4p”°
151-250 5 n0” S 0 ¢ $ o s yo w 5 0™
251-500 500 e 5 20 “ ls 100 ? s 100 4 S o0 o
501-1000 $ /W ¢ $ /gp w s 100 “ s 100 "‘f S o o0
Over 1001 $ /00 bo $ / o0 00 1$ 00 © $ /00 00 S 0
Type S-III Asphaltic Conerete, Cost () per Ton

Tons e Zone 1T  Zoneml __ ZonelV___ | ZoneV_
0-150 S 4m® s 40 |s 407 |s 4w |5 407
151250 S | Lt /A Sl 1/ el S/ S S LA/ S
251-500 50 s y0® |8 pe” 18 ye” |3 yo%
501-1000 $ ) M) oo S /0 © $ 40 w S 0% S p%
Over 1001 5@ /L% s 0% |8 yp?® $ 4p°

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 1T Zone 11T Zone IV Zone V
0-150 54 $ M"” $ 4,90"" S 40”5 4 ”
151-250 ) .(oo $ )15 % $ /590 $ )15 $ )8
251-500 5 o @ 5 /n® $  ))oe° s p° 8 Jp?®
501-1000 s 0% s e 5 /g% $  )p® 5 )
Over 1001 s N0" s a0 | /e s )10 5 yp®
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#130266
Location: W E )
]

Vendor: Name:
-EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)-
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons ' Zone | Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 T\ $ 4&)“’ s 4O |8 4@&) $ 4&9“’
B , T m i -‘
151-250 $ \'moo $ t IO $ “ cho $ | l 000 5| \OCD
251-500 5 QDGO 5| OO”D 5 ) Oow s ) () @ s , 00 v
501-1000 $ }69‘“0 s |00 00 | ) 0000 5 o0 c© g 1O 2
Over 1001 s 100 s 100% |8 ) 007 | ) 00 S 1 00°°
v
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zonel Zone 11 Zone II Zone IV Zone V
s 40 s A |5 4007 | 4007 s 400%
| ' v a0 ~— CO
151-250 $ ?,ﬂw $ ) ) 00 $ (27 $ Y. Y,
251-500 5| l 300 5| ;‘90 $ I | 900 $ | [';"@ 5 \3"'0
501-1000 $ Q)/'f’“ 5101 00 |3 (079 |5 [07% |3 )576’9
owrton s 102® |5 1pp® |s )% |5 0% |5 0>
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone I Zone IV Zone V
s 4@® s Ap” |8 4o |8 d@” | 407
I R I P IV ERT Gl O Y ER T
s s p® s 0% s (0%ls 1o s yp®
501-1000 $ m}“‘) $ ’ BRP s |03 “ls | 03% s |03
Over 1001 $ qq W $ qq w | qq w s é}c? go s C]q do
Type FC—9.5‘ Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (8) per Ton Q{Lu,l e / no mbb@((,
Tons Zone I Zone 1T Zone 111 Zone IV _ Zone V
0-150 s AR |s Am® |s 400” |s 4 |s )~
I R LI 1 (i E TS ER TS E e
251-500 s |Ip s O s (o I8 {{0°|s 10
501-1000 s 10 s 0% Is (0~ Is /0 ‘?" s 1[0 2°
Over 1001 5119 s 02 |s 0% s [(0°°|s LU0
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Areroo

#130266

Vendor: Name: Location:
| EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (8) per Ton jlgetctt) MO Veseer
Tons Zone | Zone IT Zone I Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ 4@ : $ dwa’ S Jop™ |8 4™ $ 46@‘0
151-250 N ® /. $ )/'(000 $ /0 $ //@‘w
251-500 $ "m)“’ 5 Joo @0 $ /w@m S 00® | Y 0@
501-1000 s R s o |5 Jp® s 00 |5 100
Over 1001 $ ' QQQO 5100 % $ /OO o0 $ 0900 $ /@0 0o
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (8) per Ton .NO 10y BRE(L-

__Tons Zone I Zone I Zone I Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ Z_\,QD“’ s 200° |S qop” 5 400 5 J°°
151-250 $ I)OOO S 900 |8 ppod s 190" 5 ) 0%
251-500 sy 0o s /™ |8 1% S /e 5 1J0°°
501-1000 5 1H™ s Jp? | N 0 | 1/00° S )/ o0
Over 1001 s [0 @ s //0 o s o s /P s J/9 20

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton WO a(zxﬁ?? B
Tons — Zonel Zone 11 Zone 11X Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ 4,0000 s Jp® | Jp Cols gop® s 20°
151-250 $ '\’) o 1y / /700 $ //700 $ /) 70” $ 1/)%
251-500 $ m’) w s 07 s /P )0 | 7% |3k 70'0
501-1000 $ [é’LOU s I0)%° )Y o0 $ / e $ 209 @0
Over 1001 $ qg w1 '%00 s gfe® $ '?goo s g5 @
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/‘-\
Vendor: Name: _QQMLMMAW

Location: _M

#130266

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost () per Ton
Tons _ Zonel Zone I Zone ITI Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ 4%"0 $ '4@9410 $ 4@0@ $ MW $ %w
151-250 5| 4&‘90 3 )45 $ /4{4" $ )4(00 $ /4(0?
251-500 $ /QSW 5 )P 5 ) M $ / }5—0’0 $ /%ob
501-1000 $ ,@/300 5 /937 5 93P $ )93%° s /93
Over 1001 s JISP0 |s g s eP s 0 s
Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone :W Zone 1;0 Zone 111 Zone IV ~ ZoneV
0-150 $ $ 0 $ o0 $ 0 s @
151250 $ ’4/5,2‘0‘7 $ 4/(35117 $ fgzﬂ 5 f f&'a; s Z?g
251-500 5 / % s /957 | / Ko o |s i Jas @ 5 / 3{“’
501-1000 5 HRW S /93% |5 )y 3 e s /939
Over 1001 s s e s e s s s 70

Part 3 - Asphalt Work Category 3: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require

transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (3) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone IT Zone 11T Zone IV Zone V
0-150 v 5 |(p® $ /Jpﬂ 5 /p? $ U‘p‘?‘
151-250 $ /TD'BOT) $ )@ 700 $ 19 700 $ /'7)700 $ /@74’7’
251-500 $ q ;}w s 999 $ 73,00 $ 7) o $ 9 4
501-1000 $ g%@i) $ {7 o $ W@D s g7 s § 790
Over 1001 $ 4&300 5 g30 s g3 $ {g@n $ g}@ o




Vendor; Name:

Joud C I-pr /)}NWMW{J

Location: __@Mmg

#130266

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type S-1I1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 TS L L S A L s A L A € ot | 5#°
151-250 $ //0'3“7 509 S L0 $ . /2% /9%
251-500 5 g% s 4979 5 g7% s gogee 47%
501-1000 s g2 w $ 42 $ gp° 5 927 92
Over 1001 $ % w $ ZX 7 $ gg o0 $ fg o0 ?Z”

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone I Zone IV Zone V
0-150 5 )54 3 15¢° s A AT 2t 1$4%
151-250 $ //Jo'? $ //,?00 $ /) 00 $ 7/, oo V78
251-500 $ 6}7“’0 s g9 s g7 8 g7 G 77
501-1000 $ 429 5 g2% |8 42” $ gg® g4z
Over 1001 s £9°° I $ X8 $ @gge° £y

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ I.ng $ /S-poo $ /D% $ /Spoo /8D °°
151-250 5197 0 g 07 |5 jp7° |8 yp7e° 197
251-500 $ g2.% 5 gov° $ g $ gpew 92°
501-1000 $ g7 % 5 g7 3 g7 s &77 £77°
Over 1001 s &3°° $ §3% $  g3e° $ g3% £3°
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#130266
o
Vendor: Name: SQ&N . i\'g) &)N STIV\I(/'I"DOI\) Location: M

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Conerete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone Il Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ /[/009 5 JH® S Jho® 5 /™ Sy
151-250 $ //qm $ //9"' 5 )o@ $ //74’0 I/
251-500 $ /0500 5 /039 5 930 5 /037 S /p3®
501-1000 5 ge® |5 g¢”7 3 gy s 447 5 gy
owiwr |5 4% s g4 s ¢m |5 ¢ |s MO

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 1M1 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ /bo"o $ /&0070 5 /b 9” $ /@9” $ /éﬂf"
151-250 5 Il o° 5 /), 5/ I/ S )6
251500 ) A A L LA A L ) A A Y it
501-1000 59 S"o s 4 s g fedd $ gy $ g7
Over 1001 $ Q/d’o $ 7/’0 s 4/°° s 9/ s 9/7°
Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton Zg¢feie /Nb SDvzgen //%(,r

Tons Zone 1 Zone I Zone 1L Zone IV Zone V
0-150 5 {4.90 I R s LY € IAS 2
151-250 5 J1)°° |8 200 |8 @ |8 yp $ 2

251-500

&~

97° s 7% |3 gy |s 497" |s g7”
501-1000 $ 9200 $ 9 Y 00 $ 4 200 72 oD g Zov
Over 1001 oK™ s Kg2° s §9°° s gge 9%

w3
©2

&2
&
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— #130266
Vendor: Name: \ 20&6&“ “;\W ‘Eﬁgmmmm Location: 4

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Conerete, Cost () per Ton /TE01.0€, N ZuBBHZ /Ly

Tons Zone 1 Zone II Zone TIT Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $|sp% 516D . 590"' $ }5@@ 5™
151-250 | 0700 5 )p79? $ 7™ S /)" $ 1077
251-500 3 02% |3 ggo 5 gpo 5 g $ G2
SoL-1000 s £ s g |8 & s g” | 477
Over 1001 $ KBW 8 g3® $  £3% $ L3 $ g3%

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (8) per Ton pvg [A e, /)o of

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 1T Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ /boo’o $ / /é@ O $ /éOW $ /é& o9 $ /boav
T L) L C77 L /T A LNV L
251-500 8 p3%° $ /030" $ /030" $ /0300 $ Jp39°
501-1000 $ qgﬂ $ 4 XOO $ 7g00 5 g f” 5 ggoo
Over 1001 $ %tW s gqev s gqe0 s gqo s ggee

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton Np J888/ Pvr

Tons Zone I Zone 1T Zone IIY Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ /bom 5 ) lﬂ D% 5 L0 0? 5 JpD™ S )™
151-250 $ J /bm S Wb ®© S LT S b /i
251-500 s 10/® s 10/ s N/ o0 s Jp/® 5 Jp)*”
501-1000 5 g SW $ 9 194 5 ¢ (9° 5 g0 $ g
Over 1001 5 g s g)eo 5 g/ $ g% s g/
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Vendor: Name: MMM ACTZOn) Location: /4%1/0, #130268
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone 1L Zone T Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ 409@ S g% S 400 S 4op® $ 400 oo
151250 P |0/ 1S/ | 307 |* 4307
251-500 $ ”g‘ﬂ $ //0(100 $ //90‘9 5§y |8 900
501-1000 51 gL 5 /07 e® S 7% |8 pT7® |3 jp7%®
Over 1001 510180 S /p2%° 5 /02 |8 Jp2® |8 1@9 e
Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Toms, Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 5 AD® $ 4@@0 5 400%° |3 4 5 g0
151-250 $ ] 5 $ /O‘)&’W 5 &J‘W s 5 )9co°
N I § | N A7/ /A A/ e S} M A | M
501-1000 51040 5 /04 0 S e |8 g @ 5 g o0
Over 1001 $ l Q LA /00 @0 S 0D *° S 400 w 72 00

Part 4 — Additional Traffic Control: Provide traffic control for work petformed by Entities or other contractors for milling and striping in
advance or behind paving operations.

Tons Zone 1 Zone I Zone II1 Zone IV Zone V
Hourly Rate $ ;)a) o |3 de 5 _90p%® 5 9007 $ o’)ww
Minimum Daily Rate $V_ZS9 o $ 7@ ov $ 75D 0 $ *-ZS'D o $ “ngm
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#130266

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Cencrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): No Yes @ Ye
Bidder: Vﬂ?wm N . Jows Company: ~ JOHN - Lh,@ gMSTW@A/
Address: ?O &)X / ﬂa 0 4&“/’1/@, E 3%/
Authorized Signature: /r,w Title: ?\EWN [
e p /"ﬁ__"
Clearly Print Signature: V:raowm ll JB#NS Title: %M
PHONE: 380-4b2-2047]  pax. 386~ 467-414] DATE: & /7/3
/7 7/

Clearly Print or Type Email Address: }\\l'DJ;ﬂU@@ ’WO‘W { I » oY)
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#130266

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 pm, Wednesday, August 7, 2013

PLACE OF BID OPENING: Alachua County Purchasing Division, Third Floor
County Administration Building
12 SE 1* Street
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

TO: The Entities
The undersigned, as Contractor, hereby declares that he has carefully read and examined the specifications and with full knowledge of all
conditions under which the equipment and services herein contemplated must be furnished, hereby proposes and agrees to furnish the

equipment and services according to the requirements as set out in the specifications for said equipment and service:

All Zones are measured on a radius from the intersection of Main Street and University Avenue as indicated:

Zone ] 0.0 - 10 miles
Zone 11 10.1 - 15 miles
Zone 111 15.1 - 20 miles
Zone IV 20.1 - 25 miles
Zone V 25.1 - 30 miles

Part 1 —Asphalt Work Category 1: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require
transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-IIT Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone I Zone IIT Zone IY Zone V
0-150 .| $ NO BID $ NO BID $ No BID $ NoBID - |$ NO BID
151250 $ No BID $ ﬁo ‘BID 5 NO BID , :$ NO BID $ No BID
251-500 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
501-1000 $ No BID |'$ wo BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
Over 1001 $ NO BID $ No BID $ NoBID |$ NO BID $ NO BID

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons ) Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone HI _ . Zone 1V ZoneV »
0-150 $ No BID $ No BID - $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ NO BID $ No BID $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID
251-500 $ NO BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
501-1000 $ wNo BID $ NO BID $§ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
Over 1001 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
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#130266

Vendor: Name: V. F. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: C 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Part2 - Asphalt Work Category 2: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require
transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone I1 Zone I11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ No BID $ NoBID |$ NO BID $ NOBID - |$ NO BID
251-500 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
501-1000 $ NOFBID $ w~o BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
Over 1001 $ No BID $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 .| ¥ No BID $ NoBID - |$ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ wo BID | $ NO BID 1$ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
251-500 $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
501-1000 $ No BID '$ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
Over 1001 $ No BID $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons - Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone I ' Zone 10% . Zone V
015 | $ no BID $ Ko BID $ No BID | % NO BID $ No BID
151-250 $ 169.15 _' $169.15 . |5 169.15 $169.15 _ | $169.15
251-500 $ 130.50 | $130:50 R '130..50 $130.50 $ 130.50
501-1000 $ 111.00 $111.00 $111.00 $111.00 $111.00
Over 1001 $ 99.50 $ 99.50 $ 99.50  |$ 99.50 $ 99.50
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V. E. Whitehurst &' .Sons, Inc.

#130266

Vendor: Name: Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton -
Tons Zone I Zone I Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ No BID $ No BID $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID
151-250 $172.85 $172.85 $172.85 $172.85 $172.85
251-500 $133.25 $133.25 $133.25 $133.25 $ 133.254
5011000 $ 113.30 $113.30 $113.30 $113.30 $113.30
Over 1001 $ 93.60 $ 93.60 $ 93.60 | $ 93.60 $ 93.60
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (3) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ No BID $ NOo BID $ No BID $ NO BID $NO BID
151-250 $ 220.00 $ 220.00 $ 220.00 $ 220.00 | $ 220.00
251-500 $ 168.60 $ 168.60 $ 168.60 $ 168.60 $ 168.60
501-1000 $ 142.90 $ 142.90 $ 142.90 $ 142.90 $142.90
Over 1001 5 127.50 - $ 127.50 $ 127.50 $ 127.50 $127.50
Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost (§) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone I11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ No BID $ NOo BID. $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 209.65 $209.65 $ 209.65 $209.65 $ 209.65
251-500 $ 160.85 $160.85 $ 160.85 $160.85 $ 160.85
501-1000 $ 136.40 $136.40 $ 136.40 $136.40 $ 136.40
Over 1001 § 121.80 $121.80 $ 121.80 $121.80 $121.80
Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Coét ($) per Ton
NO Rubber / NO Polymer
-Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 202.40 $202.40 $:202.40 $202.40 $ 202.40
251-500 $ 155.45 $155.45 $ 155.45 $155.45 $ 155.45
501-1000 $ 131.90 $131.90 $ 131.90 $131.90 $ 131.90
Over 1001 $ 117.80 $117.80 $ 117.80 $117.80 $ 117.80
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#130266

Vendor: Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
NO Rubber / NO Polymer

Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone IIT Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ ro BID $ NOo BID $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID
151-250 $180.90 $180.90 $180.90 $180.90 $ 180.90
251-500 $139.30. $139.30 $139.30 $139.30 $139.30
501-1000 $ 118.45 $118.45 $118.45 $118.45 $118.45
Over 1001 % 106.00 $106.00 $106.00 $106.00 $106.00

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mik) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
NO Rubber / NO Polymer ,

Tons Zone I ‘ Zone 11 Zone I11 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 220.00 $220.00 $ 220.00 $220.00 $ 220.00
251-500 $ 168.60 $168.60 $ 168.60 $168.60 $ 168.60
501-1000 $ 142,90 $142.90 $ 142.90 $142.90 $142.90
Over 1001 $ 127.50 $127.50 $ 127.50 $127.50 $127.50

Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton .
NO Rubber / RO Polymer o .

Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 . Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO' BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 209.65 $209.65 $ 209.65 $209.65 $ 209.65
251-500 $ 160.85 $160.85 $ 160.85 - $160.85 $ 160.85
501-1000 $136.40 $136.40 $ 136.40 $136.40. $ 136.40
Over 1001 $ 121.80 $121.80 $ 121.80 $121.80 $121.80
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A . . #130266
V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

Vendor: Name: Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone I Zone I1 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ NOo BID |$ wo BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-2'50' $ 241.60" $241.60 $:241.60 - $241.60 $241.60
251-500 S 184.80 $184.80 - $ 184.80 $184.80 $ 184.80
501-1000 5 156.40 $ 156.4‘0 $ 156.40 $156.40 $ 156.40
Over 1001 $ 139.40 $139.40 $ 139.40 $139.40 $ 139.40
Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 111 Zone lV | Zone V
0-150 $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 228.75 | $228.75_ $:228.75 $ 228.75 $ 228.75
251-500 $ 175.15 $175.15 $ 175.15 $175.15 $ 175.15
501-1000 $ 148.35 $148.35 $ 148.35 $ 148.35 $ 148.35
Over 1001 $ 132.25 $132.25 $ 132.25 $132.25 $ 132.25

Part3 - Asphalt Work Category 3: Tonnage requested will be placed at a single work zone. Once mobilized, equipment will not require
transport until completion of project. If tonnage is placed in multiple work zones and separated by 2,600 ft and requiring equipment to be
moved by transport equipment, price paid will be applicable to the tonnage placed and accepted at the separate work zones.

Type S-1 Asphaltié Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone Zone I1 Zone II1 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151250 $ NO ‘BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
251-500 ) No‘ BID $ No BIDV' $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
501-1000 $ NOo BID $ NO BID $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID
Over 1001 $ No BIIS; . $ No BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ No BID
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Vendor: Name:

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

BID FORM (CONT’D)

Gainesville, FL

#130266

Location:

EXHIBIT A

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type S-III Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

.Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone II1 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ No BID $ nO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ NO BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ No BID $ NO BID
251-500 $ NO BID $ NO BID " $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
501-1000 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID - $ NO BID $ NO BID
Over 1001 $ NO BID‘v $ NO BID '$ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

Type SP-9.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zonel Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 109.15 $109.15 $109.15 $109.15 $ 109.15
251-500 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 j $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15
501-1000 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15
Over 1001 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15 $ 90.15

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zonel . Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 1'11'.45 $111.45 $ 111.45 $ 111.45 $ 111.45
251-500 $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $ 92.45
501-1000 $ 92.45‘ $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $  92.45 $ 92.45
Over 1001 $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $ 92.45 $ 92.45




#130266

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons; Inc.

Vendor: Name: Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type SP-9.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone 1T Zone III Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID § NO BID '$ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 139.15 $ 139.15 $139.15 $ 139.15 $139.15
251-500 $114.20 $ 114.20 $114.20 $ 114.20 $114.20
501-1000 $ 112..20 $ 114.20 $114.20 $ 114.20 $114.20
Over 1001 $ 114.20 $ 114.20 $114.20 $ 114.20 $114.20

Type SP-12.5 (Fine) (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone Il - Zone III ~ Zone IV ZoneV
0-150 - |'$ No BID $ NO BID. $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 132.70 $ 132.70 $ 132.70 $ 132.70 $132.70
251-500 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00. $ 109.00 $ 109.00
501-1000 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00
Over 1001 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00 $ 109.00

_ . , Type FC-9.5 Asphaltic Concrete, éost ($) per Ton

NO Riibbéi / NO Polymer

Tons Zone I Zone I1 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V
0-150 | $ No BID |'s No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID .
151-250 $ 129.90 $129.90 $ 129.90 $129.90 $ 129.90
251-500 - | ¥ 106.80 $106.80 $ 106.80 $106.80 $ 106.80
501-1000 $ 106.80 $106.80 '$ 106 80 $106.80 $ 106.80
Over 1001 $ 106.80 $106.80 $ 166;80 $ 106.80 $ 106.80
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#130266

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

Vendor: Name: Location: Gainesville, FL
EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Type FC-12.5 Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
NO Rubber / NO Polymer
Tons Zone I Zone I1 Zone 11T Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $§ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 116.45 $116.45 $116.45 $116.45 $ 116.45
251-500 5 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00
501-1000 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00
- Over 1001 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00 $ 96.00
Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
NO Rubber / NO Polymer
Tons Zone 1 Zone I1 Zone 1Y Zone IV Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID $ No BID $ NoO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 140.90 $140.90 $ 140.90 $140.90 $ 140.90
251-500 $ 115.60 $115.60 $ 115.60 $115.60 $ 115.60
501-1000 $ 115.60 $115.60 $ 115.60 $115.60 $ 115.60
Over 1001 $ 115.60 $115.60 $ 115.60 $115.60 $ 115.60
. Type FC-12.5 (Virgin Mix) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton
NO Rubber / NO Polymer
Tons Zone I 'Zope 1T Zone II1 Zone 1V Zone V
0-150 $ NO BID § NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
151-250 $ 134.45 $134.45 $ 134.45 $134.45 $ 134.45
251-500 $ 110.40 $110.40 $. 110.40 $110.40 $ 110.40
501-1000 $ 110.40 $110.40 $ 110.40 $ 110.40 $ 110.40
Over 1001 $ 110.40 $110.40 $ 110.40 $ 110.40 | $ 110.40
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Vendor: Name:

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

Location:

BID FORM (CONT’D)

#130266

Gainesville, FL

EXHIBIT A

BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville

Type FC-9.5 (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asphaltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone 1 Zone 11 Zone 111 Zone IV Zone V

0-150 | $ o BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

151.250 § 154.40 $154.40 § 154.40 | $154.40 $ 154.40

251500 . | $ 126.40 $126_;4o $ 126.40 - | s126.40 $ 126.40

501-1000 $ 126.40 $126.40 5 126.40 $126.40 $ 126.40

Over 1001 $ 126.40 $126.40 $ 126.40 $126.40 $ 126.40
Type FC-iZ.S (Virgin Mix) (ARB-5) Asi)haltic Concrete, Cost ($) per Ton

Tons Zone I Zone II Zone III Zone IV Zone V

0-150 | $ o BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

151-250 $ 146.35 $146.35, $ 146.35 $146.35 $ 146.35

251-500 $ 120.00 $120.00 $ 120.00 $120.00 $ 120.00

501-1000 $ 120.00 $120.00 $ 120.00 $120.00 $ 120.00

Over 1001 $ 120.00 $120.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00

Part 4 — Additional Traffic Control; Provide traffic control for work performed by Entities or other contractors for milling and striping in
advance or behind paving operations. ’

- Tons Zone I Zone 11 Zone II Zone IV Zone V
Hourly Rate $ NO BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ wNO BID $. NO BID
Minimum Daily Rate [ § NO BID $ No BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
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#130266

EXHIBIT A
BID FORM (CONT’D)
BID NUMBER: 14-7; Annual Asphaltic Concrete Surfacing Services with the City of Gainesville
Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1 No #2 Yes No #3 Yes No
Bidder: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Company: V- E. Whitehurst & Soms, Inc.:
Address: _ 20551 N.E. 75th Street, Williston, FL 32696
Authorized Signature: é,(// , Title: President
7
Clearly Print Signature: William J. Whitehurst Title: President
PHONE: 352-528-2101 FAX: 352-528-3857 DATE: August 5, 2013
j cb@atlantié .net

Clearly Print or Type Email Address:
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