Legislative ID# 190542D

EXHIBIT A
B y
BID TORM (CONT'D) Y, E. Whitchurst & Sons, luc.
BID NUMBER: 20-1 Annual Purchase of Plant Mix Asphalt Concrete 20551 N.E. 75th Street

Williston, FL. 32696

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (i applicable circle). #1 Yes No #2 Yes No #3 Yes No

Bidder: V. E. Whitehurst & Somns, Inc. Company: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

1
i
|
<‘
|
1

Addyess: 20551 BE 75th Street

Williston, TL 32696 /w;;,”‘"m“‘\)
Authorized Signature: //OJ/%/%Z/% /ZC/ ;i‘iiie: President ‘
Clearty Print Signature: William J. Whitehurst Title: President
PHONE: 352--528-2101 FAX: 352-528~3857 DATE: June 26, 2019
Email Address: jeb@atlantic.net
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BID NUMBER:
BID OPENING DATE:
PLACE OF BID OPENING:

BIP FORM

20-1 Annual Purchase of Plant Mix Asphalt Concrete

2:60 pm, Wednesday, June 26, 2019

Alachun County Procurement, Third Floor
County Administration Building 12 SE 1* Street
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, Structural Course, Cost () per Ton

EXHIBIT A

V. B. Whitchutst 82 Sons, Inc.l
20551 N.EB. 75th Street
Witliston, FIL, 32696

Tons SP-9.5 RAP Miz SP-12.5 RAP Mix
0-150 $ 72.90 $ 68.50
151-250 $ 72.90 § 68.50
251-500 $ 72.90 $ 68.50
501-1000 $ 72.90 $ 68.50
Over 1001 § 72.90 $ 68.50

Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, Friction Course, Cost (§) per Ton

TC95 (vCi6-2%, PMA) (RAP-Mix)

FC-12.5 (PGI6-22, TMA) (RAF Mix)

Tons

0-150 $ 8830 $ 81.00

151-250 $ 88.30 $81.00

251-500 $ 88.30 $ 81.00

501-1000 $ 88.30 $ 81.00

Dver 1001 $ 88.30 $81.00

Liquid Asphalt, Cost (3) per Gallon
TYPE RS-1 . TYPE AEP-1 TYPE

GALLONS |1 e TYPE RS-2 TACK | TYPERC-70 Prime [ oo Ir;z'rsi-lxmv; N
rackiess 1Ia

0-500 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

501-1000 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ No BID

10012000 |$ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID

Over2001 | $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NO BID
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EXHIBIT B

Small Business Enterprise (SBE) Program Participation Form V. E. Whitchurst & Sons, Inc.
20551 NI, 75¢th Street

Williston, FL. 32696 )
BID NUMBER: 20-1 Annual Purchase of Plant Mix Asphalt Concrete '

OPTION 1
that our Company is an Alachua County Cer tifted Smal] Business Enterprise (SBE) regtstered pnor

1 certify to the Bid opening.

Yes (If yes, complete and sign the Iast page of this Exhibit)

@ { No, proceed to Option 2.)

Circle One:

OPTION 2
perform ALL work and that no subcontractors will be utilized for this bid..

I certify that our Company will
. J1f yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

Civcle One:

No (f No, proceed to Opfion 3.)
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EXHIBIT B
V. B, Whitchurst & Sons, Inc.

BID NUMBER: 20-1 Annual Purchase of Plant Mix Asphalt Concrete 20351 N.B. 75th Srect
- Williston, FL 32696

Vendor Name: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. Date June 26, 2019
‘.w»f»"’"’"m
/ % /
Signature W V/QM . e Title President
Printed Name: William J. Whitehurst Tile  President
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EXHIBIT C

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE V. B. Whitchurst & Sons, Inc.

20551 N.E. 75th Street
Williston, FL. 32696
Section 22.09 Competitive Sealed Bidding of the Alachua County Purchasing Code and Section 41-530 of the City’s Financial Services
Procedures Manual states that in the evaluation of bids, sll factors in the bidding process being equal, both as to dollar amount and

ability to perform, priority will be given, first, to those vendors certifying a drug-free workplace, secondly, to certified Small Business
Enterprise (SBE) bidders.

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 and Section 22,09 of the Alachua County Purchasing Code hereby
certifies that

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Tnc.

Name of Business

Does:

L. Publish & statement notifying employees that the unlawfu! manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use of a
controlied substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees for violations
of such prohibition,

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-fiee workplace,

any aveilable drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon
employees for drug abuse viclations,

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or coniractual services that are under bid a copy of the siatement
specified in subseotion (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities or
contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of

any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 1893 or of any controlled substance law of
the United States ot any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if such is
available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convioted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person anthorized to sign the statement, 1 certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

e Ji

<

Bidder's Signapfte  William J. Whiteburst, President

June 26, 2019
Date
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V, B. Whitchurst & Sons, Inc,
20551 N.E. 75th Street

Williston, Fi, 32695
EXHIBIT D

PUBLIC RECORD DECLARATION OR CLAIM OF EXEMPTION

As a bidder or proposer, any document you submit to Alachua County may be a public record and be open for personal inspection or
copying by any person. In Florida ‘public records™ are defined as all documents, papers, letters, maps, books, tapes, photographs,
films, sound recordings, data processing software, or other material, regardiess of the physical form, characteristics, or means of
transmission, made or received pursuant to law or ordinance or in connection with the transaction of official business by any agency.
Section 119.011(11), F.S. A document is subject fo personal inspection and copying unless it falls under one of the public records
exemptions created under Florida law. Please designate what portion of your bid or proposal, if any, qualifies to be exempt from
inspection and copying:

Execute either section L or IT, but not both; bidder may not modify language

1. NO EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW

No part of the bid or proposal subifiilted i$\exempt from disclosure under the Florida public records law, Ch. 119, E.8.

%M/%A/ S June 26, 2019

Bidder’s Sigifture Date
william J. Whitehurst, Presidnet

e OR---

1L EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW AND AGREEMENT TO INDEMNIFY AND DEFEND ALACHUA
COUNTY

The following pats of the bid or proposal submitted are exempt from disclosure under the Florida public records law because: (list
exempt parts and legal justification. i.e. trade secret):

By claiming that all or part of the bid or proposal is exempt from the public records law, the undersigned bidder or proposer agrees to
protect, defend, indemnify and hold the County, its officers, employees and agents free and harmless from and against any and all
claims arising out of a request to inspector copy the bid or proposal. The undersigued bidder or proposer agrees to investigate, handle,
respond to, provide defense (inoluding payment of attorney fees, court costs, and expert witness fees and expenses up to and including
any appeal) for and defend any such claim at its sole cost and expense through counsel chosen by the County and agrees to bear all
other costs and expenses related thereto, even if they (claims, ete.) are groundless, false, or fraudulent.

Bidder’s Signatire Date
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (NWIDDIYYYY}
6/20/2019

GERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY ANMEND,
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER,

THIS GERTIFICATE 1S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS

EXTEND OR ALTER THE GOVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLIGES

BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANGE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

IMPORTANT: 1f tho certlficate holder Is an ADBITIONAL INSURED, the pollcy(les) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provislans or ke endorsed,
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the poliey, certaln pollclos may requlre an endorsement. A statement on
this cerllflcate does not confer rights to the cerificate hotder In lisu of such endorsement{s).

PRODUCER y s e of Florlda, Inc.

4880 Newberry Road, Sulle 100
Gainesvllle, FL 32607

SIS Shirley HIll Shills

[TAE o 362-378-0801

fg}g“‘uﬁn gy, 352-378-2611
E-MAIL,
| AbbREss

=11

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIR#
imnsyrera: Zurich Amerlcan insurance Co, 18535
WSURED \, & \asitehuret & Sons, Ine. wsurers; Amercan Guarantee & Liabilily Insurance Co. 26247
20551 NE 75 Strest msurers: Old Republic General Insurance Corp. 24138
Wiliistion, FL. 32686 msureno: Xl Insurance America Ine. 2454
INSURERE
INSURERF 3

GOVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

REVISION NUMBER:

INDICATED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM GR CONDITION

THIS IS TO OERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIQD .

OF ANY GONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WiTH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLIGIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES, LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
N TYPE OF ISURANGE fﬁ?ﬁ'hmm POLICY NUMBER R A A LIMTS
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OGGURRENGE +1,000,000
A X OLO-4184758 10112018 | 10112019 000,
| cLamsnence GCCUR . ! | PAEAES (A etincn)__| $500,000
X | PB Ded: $5,000 MED EXP {any one person) | $5,000
- PERSONAL & ADV INJuRy | 1,000,000
| GENL AGGREGATE LIWIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000
POLICY i D Leo PRODUCTS - compiop Ace | $2,000,000
DTHER: §
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY EOMENECSINGIELMIT 41,000,000
— | (En roidont), ! L
A [5¢] M Ao BAP-4451234 10/1/2018 | 10M1/2019 BODILY INJURY (Per persorn) | §
- .raulﬁos ONLY AUTOS ONLY M $
§
UMBRELLALIAB | X | occur EAGHOCCURRENGE s 5,000,000
B 2.<- L] 1 s
EXGESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AUC0184753-03 10/1/2018 | 10/1/2019 ABGREGATE 45,000,000
pep | X | reTenmions 0 e
WORKERS COMPENSATION
C | N0 RHPLOYERS' LIABILITY -~ A3CW13041801 12019 | 1412000 (X ek X
ANYPROPIETOR/PARTNERIEXECUTIVE L, EACH ACCIDENT 31,000,000
OFFIGERMEMBEREXCLUDED? NiA
(Mand‘ljtory;)n NH(;je E\L.IXSEASE - EA EMPLOYER § 1,000,000
AR O GPERATIONS belo E1. pisease -poLioy umit | 5 4,000,000

Alachua County Public Works, Enginesting Brian Singletont P.E.; Gonla

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS /LOCATIONS JVEHICLES |ACORD 101, AddHlons} Rematks Schedits, may b altached I moye space lsrequired)
RE: Bld 20-1 Annual Purchase of Plant Mix Asphait Alaghua County Board of County Commissioner and Cliy of Gainesvills

ot #352-374-5245; Emall BSglston@AlachuaCounty.US

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Alachua County Board of County Commissionars
Cily of Galnesville

Atachua County Public Works

12 SE 1st Street, 2nd Floor

Galnas\;;llle, FL 32601

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DEBCRIBED POLICIES BE GANGELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELWERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROU[?J:?‘IS.

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-201¢ AGORD CORPORATION. All rights resarved.

/B
AUTHOR!ZEWVZ E ,./; 5 % .
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The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

A F e R it pe 1€ Dt N e




" R 00:2. 3¢ 6102 ©97 IuNL *AEPSIUFAM.
- Sl TONINAAO GIY

Y. £869-T09ZE T4 *OTTFASYUTE) -

o - 39313% ST 35 T

~-~BPTY UOTIBIISYOPUPY Lwac) “I00Tg PIE :
o ' yoowsanoely Limmo) eayserv: QL

558+825 (2SE) X » 012825 (25E) ANOHd
SESECVOIHOTE ‘NOLSTTIM LIFHLS HiSs L5VE HABON L5502

-*an] FSNOS 9 ASHNHIALHAN S A




