O o0 N WNKNPR

[ Y
WOoONOOU R WNEO

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

ORDINANCE NO. 200247

An ordinance of the City of Gainesville, Florida, related to property

maintenance standards for existing residential and non-residential

properties; repealing the existing Division 1. titled “General Requirements

for Fences and Walls” within Article I of Chapter 13 and renumbering the

existing Division 2.; repealing the existing Article II titled “Housing Code” of

Chapter 13; repealing the existing Article III titled “Commercial Building

Code” of Chapter 13; and creating a new Article II titled “Property

Maintenance Code” within Chapter 13 to adopt by reference the

International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC) with local revisions;

amending Sec. 2-339 titled “Applicable codes and ordinances” within

Division 6, Article V of Chapter 2; amending Sec. 2-377 titled “Applicability;

jurisdiction” within Division 8, Article V of Chapter 2; providing directions

to the codifier; providing a severability clause; providing a repealing clause;

and providing effective dates.

WHEREAS, the City Commission desires to replace the outdated and Gainesville-
specific Housing and Commercial Building Codes with the International Property Maintenance
Code (IPMC) with local revisions;

WHEREAS, at least 10 days’ notice has been given once by publication in a newspaper
of general circulation notifying the public of this proposed ordinance and of public hearings to be
held in the City Commission Auditorium, City Hall, City of Gainesville; and

WHEREAS, the public hearings were held pursuant to the published notice described at

which hearings the parties in interest and all others had an opportunity to be and were, in fact

heard.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE

CITY OF GAINESVILLE, FLORIDA:

Section 1. Division 1 titled “General Requirements for Fences and Walls” within Article

I of Chapter 13 of the Code of Ordinances is hereby repealed effective at 12:01am on January 1,

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

Page 1



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

2021. And the exiting Division 2 titled “Graffiti Abatement Program” is renumbered as Article
L.

CHAPTER 13. HOUSING AND COMMERCIAL BUILDING CODES

CODE: Words strickenr are deletions; words underlined are additions.

Page 2



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

Page 3



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Secs. 13-1 through 13-5. - reserved.

DPIVISION 2. ARTICLE I. - GRAFFITI ABATEMENT PROGRAM

Section 2. Article II titled “Housing Code” of Chapter 13 of the Code of Ordinances is hereby

repealed effective at 12:01am on January 1, 2021.

CODE: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

Page 4



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

-8-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

-10-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

-11-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

-12-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

-13-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-14-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-15-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-17-
CODE: Words strieker are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-18-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

CODE:

.....
----

-19-
Words strickenr are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

CODE:

-20-
Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-21-
CODE: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

22-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

-23-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-24-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-25-
CODE: Words stricker are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

CODE

-27-
. Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



=2}

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-28-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-29-
CODE: Words strickesn are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-30-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-31-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-32-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-33-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

-34-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-35-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-36-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-37-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-38-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-39-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-40-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

41-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

-42-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-43-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

-44-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

-45-
CODE: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

-46-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18

19

20

21

22

23

24

Section 3. Article I titled “Commercial Building Code” of Chapter 13 of the Code of

Ordinances is hereby repealed effective at 12:01am on January 1, 2021.

ARTICELE . —COMMERCIAL BUH-DING CODE

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

CODE: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

-49-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

-50-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

-51-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Section 4. A new Article II titled “Property Maintenance Code” within Chapter 13 of

the Code of Ordinances is hereby created effective at 12:01am on January 1, 2021.

ARTICLE II - PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

Sec. 13-16. Purpose.

The overall purpose of this Chapter is to protect the public health, safety and welfare by

establishing minimum requirements governing the maintenance, appearance and condition of

residential and non-residential premises: to establish minimum requirements for utilities,

facilities and other physical components and conditions essential to make the aforesaid premises

fit for occupancy and use: to require structural strength, stability, sanitation. adequate light and

ventilation, and safety to life and property from fire, nuisances and other hazards: to conserve

and maintain the viable housing stock to basic standards essential for occupancy and use: to

minimize the degree to which the economic welfare of adjacent property is adversely affected or

impaired: to reduce those factors which contribute to neighborhood blight: and to provide for the

repair. demolition or vacation of residential. commercial, business or industrial premises. This

-52-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

Chapter is hereby declared to be remedial and essential for the public health, safety and welfare

and it is intended that this Chapter be liberallv construed to effectuate the purposes as stated

herein.

Sec. 13-17.- Adoption

With the general and technical local amendments referenced below. the City hereby adopts the

2018 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC) published by the

International Code Council and incorporates the same by reference as if fully set forth herein.

The IPMC is adopted as the City’s Property Maintenance Code and shall be the governing law

relative to all existing buildings. structures and premises as defined herein. This Property

Maintenance Code will apply to every building or structure irrespective of when the building

was constructed, altered. or repaired and irrespective of any permits or licenses which shall have

been issued for the use or occupancy of the building or structure, for the construction or repair of

the building. or for the installation or repair of equipment or facilities prior to the effective date

of this article. This Property Maintenance Code establishes minimum requirements for

occupancy and does not replace or modify requirements otherwise established for construction.

replacement or repair of buildings except such as are contrary to and less stringent that the

provisions of this Property Maintenance Code.

(a)  General Amendments. The IPMC is amended in that:

(1)  Wherever the words "International Building Code" or "International Existing

Building Code" are found. the words "Florida Building Code" are substituted.

(2)  Wherever the term "owner-occupant” is found it is deleted.

-53-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(3)  Wherever the words "International Fire Code" are found. the words “the current

edition of the Florida Fire Prevention Code (FFPC)” are substituted. Any reference to

section numbers in the International Fire Code are likewise deleted.

(4) Wherever the words "International Residential Code" are found they are deleted.

Technical Amendments. The following sections of the IPMC are amended as follows:

(1) Section 101.1 titled "Title" is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall

be known as the City of Gainesville Property Maintenance Code, hereafier referred to in

this Chapter as "this code."”

(2)  Section 102.3 titled "Application of other codes" is amended to read as follows:

Repairs. additions. or alterations to a structure. or changes of occupancy, shall be done in

accordance with the procedures and provisions of the Florida Building Code and the

Florida Fire Prevention Code as adopted bv the City of Gainesville and the State of

Florida. If there is inconsistency between this code and the Florida Building Code or

Florida Fire Prevention Code, the Florida Building Code or Florida Fire Prevention Code

shall prevail.

(3)  Section 103.1 titled "General" is amended to read as follows: The provisions of this

code shall be administered bv the city manager or such other person or persons

designated by the city manager (the “enforcing official”). All inspections. regulations,

enforcement and hearings on violations of the provisions of this code. unless expressly

stated to the contrary, shall be under the direction and supervision of the enforcing

official.

(4)  Section 103.2 titled "Appointment" is deleted in its entirety.

-54-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(5) Section 103.4 titled "Liability" is amended so that the words "member of the board

of appeals" are substituted with the words "Code Enforcement Board or Special

Magistrate."

(6) Section 103.4.1 titled "Legal defense” is deleted in its entirety.

(7)  Section 103.5 titled "Fees" is deleted in its entirety.

(8) Section 106.2 titled "Notice of violation" is deleted in its entirety.

(9) Section 106.3 titled "Prosecution of violation" is deleted in its entirety.

(10) Section 106.4 titled "Violation penalties" is amended to read as follows: Any

person who shall violate a provision of this code. or fail to comply therewith. or with any

of the requirements thereof, shall be prosecuted within the limits provided by state or

local laws.

(11)  Section 107 titled "Notices and Orders" is deleted in its entirety.

(12) Section 108.2 titled "Closing of vacant structures" is deleted in its entirety.

(13)  Section 108.3 titled "Notice" is deleted in its entirety.

(14) Section 108.4 titled "Placarding" is deleted in its entirety.

(15) Section 108.4.1 titled "Placard removal" is deleted in its entirety.

(16)  Section 108.5 titled "Prohibited occupancy" is deleted in its entirety.

(17)  Section 108.7 titled "Record" is deleted in its entirety.

(18) Section 109 titled "Emergency Measures" is deleted in its entirety.

(19)  Section 110 titled "Demolition" is deleted in its entirety.

(20)  Section 111 titled "Means of Appeal” is deleted in its entirety.

(21)  Section 112.1 titled "Authority" is amended to read as follows: Whenever the

code official finds any work regulated by this code being performed in a manner contrary

-55-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

to the provisions of this code, the code official is authorized to issue a stop work order

after consultation with the building official.

(22) Section 112.4 titled "Failure to Comply" shall be deleted in its entirety.

(23)  Section 302.4 titled "Weeds" is amended to specify weeds or plant growth in

excess of 12 inches on residential property.

(24)  Section 302.7 titled “Accessory Structures” is amended to read as follows:

Accessory structures. including detached garages. fences and walls, shall be maintained

structurally sound and in good repair. As used in this section: Fence shall mean a barrier

constructed of materials other than masonry, including without limitation. wood, metal,

PVC or vinvyl. erected for the purpose of protection, confinement. enclosure or privacy.

The term "fence" does not include natural barriers. such as, but not limited to. trees.

hedges or shrubs. Material(s) of professional grade shall mean materials that are

manufactured for use in a fence or wall. Wall shall mean a barrier constructed. in whole

or part. of masonry, including without limitation, stone, brick. block or concrete, for the

purpose of protection. confinement. enclosure or privacy.

(a) Construction.

(1) The construction of a wall requires a building permit and is subject to the

applicable codes and review procedures of the building department.

(2) All fences and walls shall be constructed of uniform, durable. weather-

resistant materials of professional grade. Fences constructed of wood shall be

treated to resist wood-destroving organisms. Fences constructed of metal. except

56-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

galvanized metal. shall have a colored finish coat and be treated to resist rust and

corrosion.

(3) Fences and walls shall be constructed in a safe, sturdy. workmanship-like

manner. Horizontal and vertical support posts shall be placed facing the inside of

the fenced area. except where the fence is designed such that both sides are

finished with alternating vertical fence supports.

(4) No fence or wall may be constructed in a location or manner that obstructs

the vision triangle contained in the Gainesville Engineering Design and

Construction Manual.

(5)  The requirements of this section are minimum requirements and shall not be

construed to supersede any fence or wall requirements in the city code of

ordinances or in state law. such as height limitations or material requirements in

the city land development code or specific requirements for fencing around

swimming pools.

Maintenance.

(1) All fences and walls shall be maintained upright and in good condition. For

purposes of this section, upright shall mean no vertical structural member shall

list or lean to such an extent that a normally vertical structural member shall be

more than two inches out of plumb in ten feet or less of vertical distance. For

purposes of this section. in good condition means without missing, broken,

chipped or cracked elements.

(2) Missing elements shall be repaired or replaced with material of professional

orade of the same type and quality as the existing fence or wall.

-57-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(c) Prohibited fences.

(1) Fences that are constructed, in whole or in part, of razor wire or barbed

wired or similar materials are prohibited in residential zoning districts (as

classified in section 30-4.1 of the city land development code.)

(2)  Fences that are constructed of cloth, fabric or other similar materials. are

prohibited; except that such materials of professional grade may be used as a

privacy screening in conjunction with a permanent fence or wall.

(3) Temporary fences are prohibited: except that temporary fences constructed

of materials of professional grade used to protect construction and excavation

sites or to protect plants during grading and construction, are allowed for the

duration of an active building permit for the fenced site.

(d) Nonconformities. Except for fences prohibited by (c). fences on which construction

has commenced and walls for which a valid active permit has been issued. on or before October

2.2008 at 11:59 p.m. and do not conform to the construction requirements in (a) shall be allowed

to remain until destroved or removed, in whole or in part; provided such non-conforming fence

or wall otherwise complies with the maintenance requirements in (b). Following destruction or

removal, in whole or in part, of any non-conforming fence or wall. any replacement wall or fence

shall comply with the requirements of this section.

(25) Section 303.2 titled "Enclosures" is deleted in its entirety.

(26)  Section 308.3.1 titled "Garbage facilities" is deleted in its entirety.

(27)  Section 308.3.2 titled "Containers" is deleted in its entirety.

(28)  Section 506.3 titled “Grease interceptors” is deleted in its entirety.

-58-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(29)  Section 602.3 titled "Heat supply" is amended to require the supply of heat year-

round.

(30)  Section 602.4 titled "Occupiable work spaces” is amended to require the supply of

heat vear-round.

(31)  Section 603.2 titled “Removal of combustion products” is deleted in its entirety.

(32)  Section 603.3 titled “Clearances” is deleted in its entirety.

(33)  Section 603.4 titled “Safety controls” is deleted in its entirety.

(34) _ Section 603.5 titled "Combustion air" is deleted in its entirety.

(35) Section 603.6 titled "Energy conservation devices" is deleted in its entirety.

(36)  Section 606 titled "Elevators. Escalators and Dumbwaiters" is deleted in its

entirety.

(37)  Section 702.2 titled “Aisles” is deleted in its entirety.

(38) Section 702.4 titled “Emergency Escape Windows” is amended to delete the phrase

“in accordance with the code in effect at the time of construction” and the phrase “that

was in effect at the time of construction.”

(39) Section 703.2 titled “Unsafe conditions” is amended as follows: the first sentence is

amended to delete “in accordance with Section 111.1.1 of the International Fire Code.

The last sentence is amended to delete “the fire code official shall act in accordance with

Section 111.2 of the International Fire Code”.

(40) Section 703.4.1 titled “Signs” is deleted in its entirety.

(41) Section 703.5 titled “Ceilings” is deleted in its entirety.

(42) Section 703.7 titled “Vertical shafts” is deleted in its entirety.

-59-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(43) Section 703.8 titled “Opening protective closers” is amended to delete the last

sentence.

(44) Section 704.1.2 “Required fire protection systems” is amended to add “At least one

2A 10BC rated fire extinguishier shall be provided and accessible within a 75 ft. travel

distance from all areas of each regulated residential rental unit”.

(45) Section 704.1.3 titled “Fire protection systems” is amended to state “Fire protection

systems shall be inspected. maintained and tested in accordance with the appropriate

Florida Fire Prevention Code standards.” The remainder of this section is deleted in its

entirety.

(46) Section 704.2 titled “Standards” is deleted in its entirety.

(47) Section 704.2.2 titled “Records information” is deleted in its entirety.

(48) Section 704.3 titled “Systems out of service” is amended to delete the last sentence.

(49) Section 704.3.1 titled “Emergency impairments” is deleted in its entirety.

(50) Section 704.4.2 titled “Removal of existing occupant hose lines™ is deleted in its

entirety.

(51) Section 704.5.1 titled “Fire department connection access” is amended to delete the

exception.

(52) Section 704.6 titled “Single and multiple station smoke alarms” is amended to state

“Single and multiple station smoke alarms shall be installed according to the

manufactures recommendations and listing. the Florida Fire Prevention Code and Florida

Building Code. At minimum; single and multiple station smoke alarms shall be installed

and maintained in all regulated residential dwelling units, inside of each dwelling unit

-60-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

sleeping area, outside of each separate dwelling unit sleeping area in the immediate

vicinity of sleeping rooms and on every occupiable level of a dwelling unit.

(53) Section 704.6.1 titled “Where required” is deleted in its entirety.

(54) Section 704.6.1.1 titled “Group R-1" is deleted in its entirety.

(55) Section 704.6.1.2 titled “Groups R-2, R-3. R-4 and I-1” is deleted in its entirety.

(56) Section 705.1 titled “General” is amended to state “Carbon monoxide alarms and

detectors shall be installed and maintained in accordance with the Florida Fire Prevention

Code and NFPA 720 requirements. Carbon monoxide alarms and detectors shall be

provided in all regulated residential rental units with communicating attached garages.

containing fuel burning appliances or fuel burning fire places. Carbon monoxide alarms

and detectors shall be provided outside of each separate dwelling unit sleeping area in the

immediate vicinity of sleeping rooms and on every occupiable level of a dwelling unit,

excluding attics and crawl spaces.”

(57) Section 705.2 titled “Carbon monoxide alarms and detectors” is deleted in its

entirety.

Sec. 13-18. - Enforcement of and Compliance with Other Ordinances: Conflicts.

No certification of compliance with this code shall constitute a defense against any violation of

anv other ordinance of the city otherwise applicable to any structure or premises. nor shall any

provision of this code relieve any owner or operator from complying with other applicable city

ordinances or anv official of the city from enforcing any such ordinances. In the event of a

conflict between the provisions of the IPMC adopted by this chapter, and the provisions of other

parts of the Code of Ordinances. the Code of Ordinances shall prevail. Where differences occur

61-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

between the provisions of the IPMC adopted by this Chapter, and the provisions of other parts of

the Code of Ordinances, the more stringent or specific standard shall apply.

Sec. 13-19. - Right of Entrv/Inspections.

In accordance with the requirements of applicable federal or state law, the enforcement officer.

upon presentation of proper identification to the owner. operator. agent or tenant in charge of

such property. may enter any building, business. industrial premise, structure, dwelling.

apartment, apartment house. or other premises regulated by this code within the city, during all

reasonable hours to enforce this code, except in cases of emergency where extreme hazards are

known to exist which may involve the potential loss of life or severe property damage. in which

case the above limitations shall not apply.

Sec. 13-20. - Procedure When Violation is Discovered.

Whenever the enforcing authority determines that there has been or is a violation, or that there

are reasonable grounds to believe that there has been or is a violation of any provisions of this

code. the enforcement procedure set forth in Division 6 or Division 8 (as applicable) within

Article V of Chapter 2 of the Code of Ordinances shall be utilized.

Section 5. Section 2-339 titled “Applicable codes and ordinances” within Division 6,
Article V of Chapter 2 is amended as set forth below effective at 12:01am on January 1, 2021.

Except as amended herein, the remainder of Sec. 2-339 remains in full force and effect.

Article B II of Commercial building code Property Maintenance | H1 $250.00
Chapter 13 Code. when the violation is committed by the
tenant or occupant
3547+ | Insects;-outdoorstoragetrash-and-yard I S2E0.00
maintenanece
-62-

CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




f~Y

9]

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

Section 6. Section 2-377 titled “Applicability; jurisdiction” within Division 8, Article V
of Chapter 2 is amended as set forth below effective at 12:01am on January 1, 2021. Except as
amended herein, the remainder of Sec. 2-377 remains in full force and effect.

Sec. 2-377. - Applicability; jurisdiction.

(a) The Gainesville Code Enforcement Board shall have jurisdiction to hear and decide

cases in which violations are alleged of any provisions of the following provisions of this

Code of Ordinances as they may exist or may hereafter be amended by ordinance:

(9) Chapter 13, "Housing and Commercial Building Codes;" when the violation is

committed by other than the tenant or occupant.

Section 7. It is the intention of the City Commission that the provisions of Sections 1
through 6 of this Ordinance shall become and be made a part of the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Gainesville, Florida, and that the sections and paragraphs of this Ordinance may be
renumbered or relettered in order to accomplish such intentions.

Section 8. If any word, phrase, clause, paragraph, section or provision of this ordinance
or the application hereof to any person or circumstance is held invalid or unconstitutional, such
finding shall not affect the other provisions or application of the ordinance which can be given
effect without the invalid or unconstitutional provisions or application, and to this end the
provisions of this ordinance are declared severable.

Section 9. All ordinances or parts of ordinances, in conflict herewith are to the extent of

such conflict hereby repealed.

-63-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



O 0~

10

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

Section 10. This ordinance shall become effective immediately upon adoption; however,

the various sections within this ordinance shall become effective on the date/time specified in

those sections.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 17th day of September, 2020.

LAUREN POE

MAYOR
ATTEST: Approved as to form and legality
OMICHELE D. GNXINEY NICOLLE M. SHALLEY
CLERK OF THE COMMYSSION CITY ATTORNEY

This ordinance passed on first reading this 3rd day of September, 2020.

This ordinance passed on second reading this 17th day of September, 2020.

-64-
CODE: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



